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An Editorial 

Kinsey and Kosnik IV. 


THE MOST striking and telling 
failure of Kinsey's 1947 hook on 
male sexual behavior-well-noted 
at the time of publication by re­
viewers - is that there is. to use 
Lionel Trilling's words. "scarcely 
any indication in the book that 
sex has any connection with prop-

Dissociating the copulatory 
parts (the genitalia) from the gen­
erative parts (the gonads. the 
uterus and the hormonal interrela­
tionships) and from the psyche 
and the biofundaments in general. 
which incline male and female in 
different ways and in different de­

agation." (Partisan Review, April, ..grees to parenthood. dissociates 
1948.) Kosnik's book on human 
sexuality, written 30 years later, 
is similarly defective. 

Discussing sex behavior as if it 
had no relation to propagation 
suffers the same limitation as dis­
cussing spring as if the seasonal 
rains. the lengthening days, the 
increasing warmth of the sun, and 
the "spring fevers" that follow the 
vernal equinox had nothing to do 
with the greening of the land or 
the bringing forth of new animal 
life. Since this omission of Kinsey 
and Kosnik can hardly be called 
an oversight, it signifies either 
the authors' superficial and limit­
ed understanding of sex, or their 
need, deep-seated or otherwise, to 
avoid the procreative dimension, 
a dimension permeating all as­
pects of sex, and without which 
there would be no need for the 
existence of the sexes or, conse­
quently, sex itself. 

the means from its governing and 
determinative end. But sex can­
not be delimited by the subjective 
states of persons captured and en­
raptured by sensate pleasure as if 
genital expressions had a mean­
ing independent of the order of na­
ture. That millions of unwanted 
pregnancies occur annually in 
these modern times should make 
this evident. Even if modern tech­
nology is successful in physically 
separating genital parts and gen­
erative parts from each other 
through contraception or steril­
ization, it is naive to believe that 
such physical separation simulta­
neously and automatically results 
in the psychological separation of 
the love-giving and life-giving 
components inherent in lovemak­
ing. Man and woman, as one writ­
er1 put it, "embrace their biolog­
ical destinies when they embrace 
each other." When they resist em-

CHILD & FAMILY /vOL.17, No.4, 1978 242 



bracing their biological destiny, 
they become, according to psy­
chiatrist, Marynia F. Farnham,2 a 
lost sex with a thinning out of 
their interpersonal relationships 
and their sexual pleasures as such. 

Rollo MayS furthers Farnham's 
thought: 

... The modem man's rigid 
principle of full freedom (in sex) 
is not freedom at all but a new 
strhlghtj acket, in some ways 
as compulsive as the old He 
does all this because he is 
afraid of his body and his com­
passionate roots in nature, 
afraid ofthe soil and his procre­
ative power. 

Erik Erikson4 expresses a simi­
lar concern: 

Modem man, forced to limit 
his fertility, is apt to consider 
the matter of procreative in­
volvement resolved by the 
technical possibility of making 
a conscious choice in the mat­
ter of fertilization. For such 
choice, men must be readied. 
Yet an ever so 'safe' love life, if 
accompanied by a mere avoid­
ance of offspring and a denial 
of generativity, could be, in 
some, as severe a source of in­
ner tension as the denial of sex­
uality itself has been. 

These psychiatrists make evi­
dent the manner in which Kinsey 

and Kosnik trivialize sex by ig­
noring the procreative element. 
But it is Aristotle, Ii the master 
philosopher and the father of biol­
ogy, who expresses most pro­
foundly the controlling dyna­
mism of nature in this regard: 

... for any living thing that 
has reached its normal develop­
ment ... , the most natural act 
is the production of another 
like itself, an animal producing 
an animal, a plant a plant, in 
order that, as far as its nature 
allows, it may partake in the 
eternal and divine. That is the 
goal towards which all things 
strive, that for the sake of 
which they do whatsoever their 
nature renders possible. . .. 
Since then no living thing is 
able to partake in what is eter­
nal and divine by uninterrupt­
ed continuance ... , it tries to 
achieve that end in the only 
way possible to it, ... so it ... 
continues its existence in some­
thing like itself-not numeri­
cally but specifically one. HR 
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A JOINT STATEMENT 


Breast-Feeding 
A Commentary in Celebration of the 
International Year of the Child, 1979 

DESPITE increasing evidence 
for the apparent superiority of hu­
man milk, formula-feeding has 
progressively supplanted breast­
feeding throughout much of the 
industrialized world, with the ex­
ception of the Soviet Union and 
Israel.I The decline of breastfeed­
ing in industrialized society be­
gan about 50 years ago, then 
spread to developing countries. 
This change in feeding patterns 
has had implications for infant 
morbidity and mortality and for 
the economy of those nations 
which can least afford to waste 
their resources. 2 

The need to intensify the pro­
motion of a return to breastfeed­
ing has been stated in several doc­
uments. 3 4 A resolution adopted 
by the World Health Organiza­
tion in May 1974 urged all mem­
ber countries to undertake vig­
orous action, 5 and an Internation­
al Pediatric Association seminar 
on nutrition in 1975 placed spe­
cial emphasis on education pro­
grams.6 

For much of the population in 
developing countries, both eco­
nomic and health considerations 

speak conclusively for breast feed­
ing.7 8 The physiologic role of 
breastfeeding has received less 
emphasis in the industrialized 
world because of the low morbid­
ity and mortality of bottle-fed in­
fants, which has resulted from nu­
tritional and technological ad­
vances in the formulation and 
manufacture of infant formulas9 10 

as well as from the higher stan­
dards of housing, sanitation, and 
public health services in these 
countriesY However, newer in­
formation suggests that signifi­
cant advantages still exist for the 
breastfed infant,I2 13 including 
one study in which a lower mor­
bidity was reported during the 
first year of life.14 Therefore, it 
seemed timely to examine and 
evaluate present-day information, 
to provide up-to-date guidance for 
physicians in counseling mothers 
with regard to feeding their in­
fants, to discuss factors related to 
the decline of breastfeeding in the 
United States and Canada, and to 
propose ways and means to en­
courage breast feeding if the ad­
vantages of breastfeeding prove 
compelling. 
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NUTRITIONAL AND 

PHYSIOLOGICAL 


PROPERTIES OF HUMAN MILK 


On teleological grounds. it is 
reasonable to suppose that the 
milk of each species is well adapt­
ed to the particular needs of that 
species. On this basis, the various 
properties. of human milk will be 
compared with those of infant for­
mulas. 

Nutrition 

Differences in the composition 
of human milk and unmodified 
cow's milk have been known for 
many yearsY' 16 Early attempts 
to substitute unmodified cow's 
milk for human milk were unsatis­
factory for feeding infants. Heat 
treatment, homogenization, and 
the addition of carbohydrate to 
cow's milk improved to some ex­
tent its usefulness and tolerance 
by infants. but protein and ash 
levels were still unphysiologically 
high, and the fat was absorbed 
poorly. 

Newer knowledge of nutritional 
and physiological needs of infants 
and advances in technology have 
led to the development of newer 
infant formulas which provide 
many of the nutritional and phys­
iological characteristics of breast 
milk.17 18 However, there are still 

INITIATED BY the Nutrition Committee 
of the Canadian Paediatric Society. this 
statement was prepared by both the Com­
mittee on Nutrition of the American Acad­
emy of Pediatrics and the Nutrition Com­
mittee of the Canadian Paediatric Society. 

BREASTFEEDING 

differences between infant for­
mulas and breast milk,19 and we 
believe human milk is nutritional­
ly superior to formulas for the fol­
lowing reasons. 

Fat and Cholesterol. Lipids of 
human milk are better absorbed 
by infants than those of cow's 
milk,20 mainly because of the fat­
ty acid composition and the posi­
tion of the fatty acids on the glyc­
erol molecule. Human milk has a 
high oleic acid content,21 and the 
palmitate residue is mainly in the 
2-position of the glycerol mole­
cule.22 This improves its digesti­
bility. The presence of significant 
lipolytic activity in human milk 
may also help fat absorption.23 
Human milk lipids are better ab­
sorbed than those of earlier mar­

26keted infant formulas. 24- Vege­
table oils, which replace butter­
fat in newer infant formulas,27 28 
have significantly improved fat 
absorption29-even in the first 
month of life-to practically the 
level achieved with breast milk. 30 

In preterm newborn infants fed 
formulas, fat malabsorption may 
still be as high as 25% to 30%.31 
Medium-chain triglycerides (MCT) 
permit fat absorption similar to 
that from breast milk.32 33 Poor 
fat absorption makes it difficult 
for preterm infants to meet ener­
gy requirements, and nitrogen re­
tention may also be decreased. 
Breast milk or MCT-containing 
infant formulas help overcome 
this problem. 

When the butterfat of milk is 
replaced by vegetable oils in in­
fant formulas to provide better 
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fat absorption, most of the choles­
terol is removed. Thus, these for­
mulas are practically devoid of 
cholesterol, but human milk con­
tains cholesterol. Cholesterol may 
play a significant role in ear­
ly feeding of the infant. Even 
though humans synthesize cho­
lesterol efficiently, some authors 
have suggested that exogenous 
cholesterol for formation of nerve 
tissue or for synthesis of bile salts 
may be useful to the infant. It 
would be difficult to determine 
this experimentally. Another 
question is prompted by animal 
studies suggesting that the inges­
tion of cholesterol during infancy 
may ind1,lce enzymes that can 
subsequently better metabolize 
cholesterol and thereby result in 
lower serum cholesterol levels 
early in life.34 36 This has not been 
confirmed in other animal studies 
or retrospective and cross-sec­
tional studies carried out in in­
fants. High cholesterol feeding 
did not protect the subjects 
against high serum cholesterol 
levels later in life.36 37 An ongo­
ing, prospective, longitudinal 
study in the Boston area38 seems 
to show that 30-year-old adults 
who were exclusively breast fed 
for at least two months had sig­
nificantly lower serum cholesterol 
levels than those who had been 
breastfed for less than two 
months. This finding is now being 
tested in a larger group of sub­
jects from four other longitudinal 
studies. Because subjects in the 
Boston study had received evapo­
rated cow's milk (which does con­

tain cholesterol), it is difficult to 
attribute the findings to choles­
terol per se. Active research is 
needed to determine the effects of 
dietary cholesterol or breastfeed­
ing on serum cholesterol level and 
the incidence of arterial disease in 
later life. 

A recent concern about the fat 
composition of infant formulas is 
the relatively high polyunsaturat­
ed fatty acid content of most of 
them. Vegetable oils, which are 
well absorbed by the infant, are 
usually higher in polyunsaturated 
fatty acid content than the fat in 
"average" breast milk. Linoleic 
acid or polyunsaturated fatty 
acid levels in human milk vary 
from 8% to 20% of the fat,39 40 de­
pending on the type of fat con­
sumed by the mother, but the 
average level for human milk in 
recent years is considered to be 
about 14%.41 The physiologic con­
sequences of feeding the full-term 
infant a formula which has a lin­
oleic acid content two or three 
times the average in human milk 
are not known. However, in pre­
term infants, formulas with high 
levels of polyunsaturated fatty 
acids may cause a relative or ab­
solute deficiency of vitamin E42 
(characterized by hemolytic ane­
mia) as a result of increased lipid 
peroxidation, particularly when 
iron supplements are also given. 
This is reviewed in a recent state­
ment on feeding low-birth-weight 
infants.43 

Protein. The neonatal and suck­
ling periods are characterized by 
a level of anabolic activity almost 
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never equaled later in life. This 
is especially true in low-birth­
weight infants. Clearly then, it is 
vital to provide an optimum 
source and level of nitrogen in­
take.44 45 Most formulas used for 
full-term and preterm infants are 
based on cow's milk protein.46 Re­
cent studies4? 48 suggest that cur­
rent estimates of protein require­
ments of preterm infants may be 
too high because they are based 
on cow's milk protein rather than 
on human milk protein. The total 
level of protein in formulas is 
higher than in human milk to pro­
vide a margin of safety for the in­
fant. 

The proteins in human mjlk dif­
fer qUalitatively from those in 
cow's milk. In the latter, the ca­
sein/albumin-globulin whey ratio 
is approximately 76:24; in human 
milk it is approximately 40:60. 
The major fraction of albumin­
type protein in cow's milk whey is 
composed of f3 -lactoglobulin, 
which is not present in human 
milk.49 The major albumin of hu­
man milk whey is a -lactoglobu­
lin. Some milk-based formulas 
have been made from demineral­
ized whey and milk to provide a 
casein/whey ratio similar to that 
in human milk. The sulfur amino 
acids in cow's milk are provided 
mainly by methionine, with a 
small amount of cystine; relative­
ly more cystine is present in hu­
man milk. Because of this lower 
protein content, human milk also 
contains less aromatic amino 
acids than cow's milk. Thus, the 
amino acid composition of human 

BREASTFEEDING 

milk is particularly suited to the 
metabolic peculiarities of the new­
born infant, especially those of 
the preterm infant, whose liver is 
inefficient in converting methio­
nine to cystine and in metaboliz­
ing tyrosine. 50 There are notable 
differences between the plasma 
amino acid patterns of preterm in­
fants fed human milk and those 
fed cow's milk-based infant for­
mulas,51 but the importance of 
this remains unclear. 

Breast milk also contains a va­
riety of nucleotides.52 They pro­
vide a source of nonprotein nitro­
gen which has been postulated to 
play a role in anabolism and 
growth. In this context, it is inter­
esting to note that recent analy­
ses of human milk from weil-nour­
ished mothers who had been lac­
tating for two to three months 
showed that the average protein 
concentration was only 0.88 
gmJdl, representing about 75% of 
the total nitrogen; the remaining 
25% was supplied as nonprotein 
nitrogen.53 Previous estimates of 
breast milk protein were based on 
determination of total nitrogen 
by Kjeldahl N-analysis, which did 
not distinguish protein nitrogen 
from nonprotein nitrogen. In 
cow's milk, only 6% of the total 
nitrogen is supplied as nonprotein 
nitrogen54; the remainder is sup­
plied as intact protein. Whether 
some of the factors in the nonpro­
tein nitrogen in human milk are of 
nutritional significance to the in­
fant remains to be studied. 

I ron. The iron content of milk 
from all mammalian species is 
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low. In a recent study,66 an aver­
age of 0.2 to 0.3 ,ag/ml was found 
in term human milk. Teleological­
ly, the low iron concentration in 
human milk may be extremely 
useful because there are two bac­
teriostatic proteins in human 
milk56 -lactoferrin and transfer­
rin - which lose their bacterio­
static properties when saturated 
with iron. A review of the relation 
of the iron content of milk to the 
incidence of infection was recent­
ly published. 57 Lactoferrin is pres­
ent in human milk in much higher 
quantities than in cow's milk. 58 
The small amount in milk used to 
make infant formulas is dena­
tured, and its bacteriostatic prop­
erties have been lost in processing 
the formula. 

Data suggest that about 50% of 
the iron in human milk is ab­
sorbed; iron in pasteurized cow's 
milk is less well absorbed.59iH Mc­
Millan et al.62 recently reported 
that the iron in human milk is suf­
ficient to meet the iron require­
ments of the exclusively breast­
fed, full-term infant until he tri­
ples his birth weight. It has been 
postulated that the better avail­
ability of iron in human milk, as 
compared to cow's milk, may be 
the result of the lower content of 
protein and phosphorus and the 
higher levels of lactose and vita­
min C.63 Present-day infant for­
mulas include most of these ad­
tantages (i.e., lower protein and 
phosphorus and a greater lactose 
and vitamin C content). Heat 
treatment in making the formula 
has also significantly improved 

iron absorption.64 In 1970, Gross 
found that about 50% of the iron 
in infant formula containing 1.4 
,ag/ml was retained by infants.66 
The infant fed pasteurized cow's 
milk too early in life is prone to 
iron deficiency partly because the 
milk is a poor source of iron and 
partly because cow's milk which 
has not been properly heat-treat­
ed causes significant gastrointes­
tinal blood loss in some infants.66 
This is not found with heat-treat­
ed formulas. 

Overfeeding and the obesity 
question 

The relationship between infant 
feeding and obesity in later life is 
still poorly understood, but it has 
been the subject of many confer­
ences and papers.67 Obesity is ex­
tremely prevalent in Canada68; 
10% of the men and 30% of the 
women are obese. Obesity is also 
prevalent in the United States, 
where current estimates indicate 
that 25% to 33% of the popUla­
tion is overweight or obese.69 The 
effects of obesity probably in­
clude decreased life expectancy, 
but evidence for increased mortal­
ity from hypertension and cardio­
vascular disease is still conflict­
ing.70 

Some studies have shown a 
higher prevalence of obesity in 
formula-fed infants than in 
breast fed infants71; other studies 
show no difference between for­
mula-fed and breast fed infants.72 
Studies have suggested that 
obese infants may be at increased 
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risk of becoming obese children73 

and adults, 74 75 but the evidence is 
fragmentary and at times con­
flicting. Although animal studies 
suggest that early overfeeding in­
creases the cellularity of the adi­
pose tissue, there is also evidence 
that fat-cell multiplication in hu­
mans continues throughout child­
hood. 76 In any event, because the 
first few years of life may be a 
critical time for adipose tissue de­
velopment, excessive weight gain 
should be avoided during this 
time and throughout childhood. 
Overfeeding in infants may affect 
food habits and regulation of 
energy intake later in childhood 
and adult life. 77 78 Although cur­
rent infant feeding practices are 
associated with a high prevalence 
of obesity in infants, the extent to 
which this predisposes to obesity 
in childhood and adult life is still 
uncertain. 

There are several reasons why 
breastfeeding may better control 
caloric intake than formula-feed­
ing. Milk intake by the breastfed 
infant is determined primarily by 
the amount needed to satisfy the 
infant; the mother of the formula­
fed infant may see some formula 
left in the bottle and induce the 
infant to consume more. 79 In addi­
tion, recent studies have shown 
that milk samples from nursing 
mothers at the end of feeding con­
tain much higher levels of lipid 
and protein than at the beginning 
of the feeding; this change in com­
position may satiate the infant or 
in some way signal a cessation of 
feeding.~o 

BREASTFEEDING 

However, a more significant 
fact may be that the early intro­
duction of solid foods, which adds 
greatly to the caloric intake of the 
infant, has paralleled the use of 
infant formulas. In a study in En­
gland, twice as many bottle-fed 
infants as breastfed infants were 
receiving solid foods at age 2 
months. 81 

Immunologic considerations 

At birth the newborn infant is 
suddenly transferred from a regu­
lated environment to one in which 
prompt adaptation is required for 
survival. He must receive ade­
quate nourishment and quickly 
develop immunologic mecha­
nisms to enable him to exist in a 
hostile environment. There is in­
creasing evidence that newborn 
infants can acquire certain impor­
tant elements of host resistance 
from breast milk while matura­
tion of his own immune system is 
taking place.82 The human breast 
secretes antibodies to some intes­
tinal microorganisms, and this 
may help protect breastfed in­
fants from enteric infections.83-85 

An important recent observation 
has established the presence of an 
enteromammary system by which 
enteric antigen-stimulated muco­
sal plasma cells in the mother mi­
grate to breast tissue where they 
secrete antibodies or are secreted 
directly into breast milk where 
antibodies are produced. 86 Most 
of the factors contributing to im­
munologic protection cannot be 
supplied by heat-treated formula. 
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The critical role of breastfeed­
ing in the prevention of gastroen­
teritis in infants in developing 
countries has been demonstrated. 
Although gastroenteritis is less 
common in infants in industrial­
ized countries, breastfed infants 
have been shown to be less sus­
ceptible.87 A recent study88 fur­
ther suggests that breastfeeding 
is protective against intestinal in­
fections, but only when it is an on­
going process. Respiratory infec­
tions, meningitis, and Gram-neg­
ative sepsis are also reported to 
be less frequent among breast­
fed infants.89·91 However, a small 
study in an affluent community 
has shown no difference in resis­
tance to infection between breast­
and formula-fed infants.92 A 
study in a Canadian Eskimo pop­
ulation concluded that children 
who had been breast fed for at 
least one year had an incidence of 
chronic otitis media that was one­
eighth that of children who had 
been bottle-fed as infants.93 

The newborn infant does not re­
ceive a full complement of anti­
bodies transplacentally. Immuno­
globulin G (IgG) is provided in 
this manner; IgA and IgM are 
not. The serum levels of these 
three immunoglobulins are signif­
icantly higher in colostrum-fed in­
fants. Some intestinal absorption 
of these macromolecules may 
take place,94 although, unlike 
other animal species, human co­
lostral antibodies are not ab­
sorbed from the intestine in sig­
nificant quantities during the 
neonatal period. In colostrum and 

breast milk, secretory IgA is the 
dominant immunoglobulin.96 It is 
resistant to proteolysis and con­
fers passive mucosal protection of 
the gastrointestinal tract against 
the penetration of intestinal or­
ganisms and antigens.96 

Breast milk is also a source of 
the iron-binding whey protein, 
lactoferrin. It is normally about 
one-third saturated with iron and 
has an inhibitory effect on Esch­
erichia coli in the intestine. Its 
bacteriostatic effect is diminished 
as it becomes saturated with 
iron.97 98 Heating also results in 
loss of its iron-binding capacity as 
well as of its inhibitory effect on 
E. coli. Arguments against the 
fortification of infant formula 
with iron, on the basis of saturat­
ing lactoferrin, have no validity 
because heat-treated infant for­
mula has no inhibitory effect on 
the growth of E. coli when com­
pared to fresh, unprocessed hu­
man or cow's milk. The addition 
of iron (12 mglliter) does not 
change the rate of growth of E. 
coli in formula. 99 There is no evi­
dence of an increased incidence of 
infection in infants fed iron-forti­
fied formulas compared with 
those fed unfortified formulas. 

Lysozymes are bacteriolytic en­
zymes which are more abundant 
in human milk than in cow's 
milk.loO Bacterial lysis by IgA 
antibodies does not occur unless 
lysozymes are present. lOl The bio­
logic importance of low concen­
trations of specific complement 
fractions C3 and C4 in human 
milk is unknown at present. 
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Living leukocytes are normally 
present in human colostrum.l02 103 
Macrophages comprise about 
90% of the cells and are found in a 
concentration of about 2,100/cu 
mm. These cells have the ability 
to synthesize complement, lyso­
zyme, and lactoferrin. Lympho­
cytes comprise 10% of the cells; 
some are T cells which may have 
the ability to transfer delayed hy­
persensitivity from the mother to 
her infant; others are B cells 
which synthesize IgA. Although 
the biologic importance of the co­
lostral cells to the infant has yet 
to be determined, pregnant wom­
en orally immunized with a non­
pathogenic strain of E. coli during 
the last month of gestation pro­
duce colostrum with IgA-produc­
ing plasma cells that can synthe­
size antibodies to E. coli liposac­
charide.l04 

Another component of the pos­
sible "nutritional immunity" con­
ferred by breast milk is the main­
tenance of a microflora in which 
Lactobacillus bifidus is predomi­
nant.l05 The alimentary canal is 
sterile at birth; within a few hours 
bacterial colonization occurs. Af­
ter three or four days, more than 
99% of the flora consists of the 
anaerobic L. bifidus, with a pau­
city of putrefactive bacteria such 
as the Gram-negative anaerobes 
(Bacteroides, Proteus, Clostrid­
ium, and E. coli). The mechanisms 
by which a wholly breast fed in­
fant is able to maintain an acid 
stool with L. bifidus as the pre­
dominant organism are poorly un­
derstood, but they probably in-
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volve several complex, interde­
pendent factors, including the low 
buffering capacity of breast 
milk,t06 the high lactose content 
of milk,107 specific L. bifidus 
growth-promoting factors,lOS and 
the destruction of ingested E. coli 
by lactoferrin in the alkaline pH 
of the small intestine. 109 Even 
though most infant formulas pro­
vide a lactose content similar to 
that of human milk and a buffer­
ing capacity almost as low as that 
of human milk, the predominant­
ly L. bifidus flora is not main­
tained. With the introduction of 
supplementary milk feedings or 
solid foods in breastfed infants, 
the microflora changes to the 
usual adult type. 

Breast milk also spares the gas­
trointestinal tract from exposure 
to foreign food antigens at a time 
when macromolecules may be 
readily absorbed110 and may 
cause a local reaction. Evidence 
suggests that allergic manifesta­
tions later in childhood (such as 
eczema, rhinitis, and asthma) are 
more prevalent in bottle-fed in­
fants than in breastfed infants, 
presumably because of the early 
exposure to cow's milk and other 
food antigens.mom The incidence 
of cow's milk allergy is low, but, 
when it does occur, it may cause a 
wide spectrum of clinical symp­
toms and affect the jejunal muco­
sal histology and growth.114 115 In 
a Boston study, 1I6 a slightly re­
duced occurrence of allergic mani­
festations during childhood and 
adult life was found in persons 
who were wholly breastfed up to 2 
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months of age. This reduction 
was more evident when breast­
feeding was coupled with a nega­
tive history of allergy. A recent 
study has noted a reduction in al­
lergic disease in breastfed infants 
with a strong family history of al­
lergy, strict environmental con­
trol, and delayed immunization. I 17 

Immunologic immaturity of the 
gut is considered to be a factor of 
possible importance in the patho­
genesis of necrotizing enteroco­
litis.us This frequently fatal con­
dition is rare in low-birth-weight, 
breastfed neonates. Its frequency 
is apparently increased in pre­
term infants fed hypertonic for­
mulas. ll9 A similar disorder can 
be produced experimentally in 
goats by feeding dialyzed milk of 
higher osmolality.I2o Fresh rat 
breast milk is protective in the 
newborn rat SUbjected daily to 
hypoxia.l21 However, the degree 
of protection offered by breast 
milk against necrotizing enteroco­
litis in the human infant is not yet 
known. At a recent workshop on 
human milk in premature infant 
feeding, the need for active re­
search to determine if it is protec­
tive and to identify the properties 
most important for such protec­
tion was emphasized.122 

Much remains to be learned 
about the role of the secretory im­
munoglobulin system and its rela­
tionship to viral, bacterial, and 
food antigens in the early months 
of life. 

The sudden infant death syn­
drome (SIDS) is the most fre­
quent cause of death in infants be­

tween 1 and 12 months of age.123 
It has been reported by someI24 125 

to occur significantly less often in 
breastfed infants, although oth­
ersI26 127 have found no associa­
tion with the type of feeding. 
SIDS is probably a multifactorial 
condition of presently unknown 
etiology and pathogenesis. 

Miscellaneous 

The low renal solute load in 
breast milk provides a margin of 
safety for the young infant with 
physiologically immature renal 
function. 128 This was extremely 
important some years ago when 
high-protein, high-solute for­
mulas were fed. It is of less conse­
quence today because infant for­
mulas now provide renal solute 
loads which are not greatly in ex­
cess of those of breast milk. In 
low-birth-weight infants weighing 
less than 1,500 gm, the low so­
dium129 and calcium130 content of 
formulas, and perhaps of pooled 
term human milk, 181 may lead 
to hyponatremia and impaired 
growth and provide insufficient 
calcium for skeletal mineraliza­
tion. Based on these consider­
ations, some increases in mineral 
levels might be made in formulas 
intended for use by premature in­
fants to achieve a mineral reten­
tion equivalent to that in utero. 132 

At a global level, breast feeding 
may playa role as a means of con­
traception,133 but it is not reliable 
for the individual mother. There 
may be a significant delay in ovu­
lation in many mothers when in-

CHILD & FAMILY I VOL. 17, NO.4, 1978 252 

http:litis.us


fants are fully breastfed. Ovula­
tion and menstruation are de­
layed for at least ten weeks in 
some women, and up to six 
months in others.134-136 In some 
cultures, the contraceptive effect 
is attributed in part to the taboo 
of sexual intercourse while the 
mother is breastfeeding the in­
fanU 37 138 Although earlier oral 
contraceptives - which contained 
large doses of both estrogens and 
progestins-tended to suppress 
lactation, the newer preparations 
- which contain progestins alone 
- do not interfere with milk secre­
tion and may even increase it. 139 

Many drugs ingested by a lac­
tating mother will be present in 
her milk and excreted in amounts 
depending on various factors, 
such as blood levels, dissociation 
constants, and fat solubility. This 
subject has been well reviewed. 140 
Drugs such as antithyroid com­
pounds, antimetabolites, antico­
agulants, and most cathartics 
may be hazardous to the nursing 
infant, and a nursing mother 
should be advised not to take 
these drugs.141 Recent findings of 
organochlorine insecticides such 
as DDT, polychlorinated biphe­
nyls (PCBs), and other environ­
mental pollutants in breast milk 
have raised questions which have 
not as yet been resolved in re­
gard to the safety of breastfeed­
ing by all mothers.142 The restric­
tion of the use of DDT resulted in 
a decrease in the concentrations 
found. 143 144 No such change has 
been seen for PCBs, but banning 
of the compound is more recent.14S 
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Early and prolonged contact be­
tween a mother and her newborn 
infant can be an important factor 
in mother-infant "bonding" and in 
the development of a mother's 
subsequent behavior to her in­
fant.146 147 It has been reported 
that mothers who have had pro­
longed physical ("skin-to-skin") 
contact with their newborn in­
fants exhibit greater soothing be­
havior, engage in more eye-to-eye 
contact with the infant later in in­
fancy, and are more reluctant to 
leave their infants with someone 
else than mothers who have had 
the lesser amount of contact 
which prevails in most maternity 
wards. 148 Breastfeeding may pro­
mote maternal-infant bonding, 
particularly when this contact is 
desired by the mother.149 

EPIDEMIOLOGY OF 

BREASTFEEDING 


A steady decline in breastfeed­
ing was documented in both de­
veloped and developing countries 
until recently. Before 1950, in the 
industrialized world, breastfeed­
ing was more common among the 
lower social classes. However, in 
the past 10 to 15 years the decline 
in breastfeeding as a concomitant 
of socioeconomic development 
has changed. Data from the Unit­
ed States show that breastfeeding 
is even less commonly practiced 
among lower income groups than 
among higher income groups. ISO 
In the 1940s, approximately 65% 
of the infants in the United States 
were breastfed while in the hospi­
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tal.UII By 1972, only 28% and 
15% were nursed by their moth­
ers by the time they reached the 
age of 1 week and 2 months, re­
spectively.11>2 Statistics from the 
United Kingdom also reveal a sig­
nificant decline, with figures of 
60% in 1948 and a little more 
than 40% in 1968.163 In a market­
ing survey completed in 1973 by 
Ross Laboratories in Canada, 
35% of the infants were breast fed 
during the first week of life; by 3 
and 6 months, only 17% and 6%, 
respectively, were still breastfed. 
Consumer Reports states that, in 
1975 in the United States. 38% of 
the women leaving the hospital 
after childbirth reported they 
were breastfeeding. In 1976, sur­
veys by Mead Johnson Company 
and Ross Laboratories found that 
53% of infants in the United 
States and 48% of those in Can­
ada were breastfed at the time of 
discharge from the hospital. 

FACTORS RESPONSIBLE 

FOR THE DECLINE 


OF BREASTFEEDING 


Historically, bottle feeding was 
intended to replace the wet nurse 
when breastfeeding by the moth­
er was not possible, because many 
wet nurses were irresponsible and 
only the wealthy could afford a 
healthy wet nurse.1&4 Pasteuriza­
tion of milk helped initiate sanita­
tion practices which permitted 
some substitution of cow's milk 
for breastfeeding. Late in the 
19th century, heat treatment of 
evaporated milk reduced curd ten­

sion; the addition of carbohydrate 
early in the 20th century de­
creased excessive protein and 
electrolyte levels, which further 
improved bottle feeding. The 
technologic progress and nutri­
tional discoveries of more recent 
decades made bottle feeding a via­
ble alternative. Bottle feeding 
gradually replaced breastfeeding 
and resulted in the development 
of infant formulas which provide 
the best alternative for meeting 
nutritional needs during the first 
year when breastfeeding is unsuc­
cessful, inappropriate, or stopped 
early.155 

With the profound social trans­
formations which have taken 
place in the Western world, 
breastfeeding is frequently con­
sidered incompatible with modern 
life-styles or with work outside 
the home. Furthermore, the ad­
vantages of breastfeeding in 
terms of nutrition, immunity, and 
psychophysiologic interaction be­
tween the mother and her off­
spring are frequently considered 
to be outweighed by possible in­
convenience, by fear or failure of 
lactation, and by anxieties con­
cerning infection and/or cosmetic 
effects on the breasts. In addi­
tion, the act of breastfeeding is 
frequently regarded as a source of 
embarrassment or shame, and it 
is usually carried out privately. It 
is a curious commentary on our 
society that we tolerate all de­
grees of explicitness in our litera­
ture and mass media as regards 
sex and violence, but the normal 
act of breastfeeding is taboo. 
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When breastfeeding was uni­
versal, as it still is in some soci­
eties, the "art" was handed down 
through the generations. This fa­
miliar personal heritage was com­
forting and reassuring to the 
young mother. In Western soci­
eties, the new mother frequently 
receives little encouragement to 
breastfeed from her husband, rel­
atives, friends, and even physi­
cians. Furthermore, because for­
mula-feeding is safe, acceptable, 
and promoted as "nearly identi­
cal" in nutritional composition to 
breast milk, the new mother may 
have little inclination to breast­
feed. 

Nowadays, mothers in many 
maternity wards are expected to 
formula-feed their infants for the 
convenience of the hospital staff. 
To enable the new mother to 
breastfeed, she needs free access 
to her infant, knowledgeable help, 
encouragement, and instruction. 
Recent studies have shown a dra­
matic increase in breast feeding 
with in-hospital instruction from 
staff and mothers. lSS"108 Sedg­
wick159 has found that 96% of the 
mothers were able to breastfeed 
successfully when circumstances 
were favorable. 

Successful lactation is the re­
sult of reflex interactions between 
the mother and her offspring. ISO 
Stimulation of the breast, the 
areola, and the nipple leads to the 
secretion of prolactin in the moth­
er's circulation and to milk secre­
tion in the alveoli. 161 The suckling 
stimulus brings about the release 
of oxytocin, which contracts myo-

BREASTFEEDING 

epithelial cells around the alveoli, 
thereby ejecting milk into lac­
teals.1S2 Emotional tension and 
stress readily inhibit this reflex; 
therefore, the anxieties of the 
young mother during a short stay 
on an obstetric ward - where she 
often receives inadequate instruc­
tion and little emotional support 
-may explain why success is elu­
sive, even when the mother wish­
es to breastfeed. The main cause 
of lactation failure is thought to 
be inhibition of the "milk ejection 
reflex." 

Drugs such as chlorpromazine 
and oxytocin nasal spray163 can 
be used for a short period to as­
sist a mother who is having diffi­
culty with "let down" in establish­
ing successful lactation. The rea­
sons for stopping breast feeding 
after the mother goes home in­
clude cracked nipples and infec­
tion164 or erroneous advice to ad­
here to a rigid three- to four-hour 
feeding schedule.16s 166 Many in­
fants cry to be fed every two to 
three hours during the first two 
weeks of life. This can lead some 
mothers to feel that they have an 
inadequate supply of milk. If 
mothers resort to supplemental 
feeding, lactation may cease with­
in a week or so because the devel­
opment of full milk production 
is dependent on emptying the 
breasts. 167 168 This is also the 
problem with the advice to feed 
"ten minutes on each breast," 
which may deprive the infant of 
the nutritional benefits of milk 
of a somewhat different composi­
tion at the end of a feed. 169 Good 
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breastfeeding techniques are de­
scribed in detail by Applebauml70; 
when they are practiced, breast­
feeding can be a convenient and 
pleasant way for the majority of 
women to feed their infants. l7l 172 

WAYS TO INCREASE 

BREASTFEEDING 


Breastfeeding is strongly rec­
ommended for full-term infants, 
except in the few instances where 
specific contraindications exist. 
Ideally, breast milk should be 
practically the only source of nu­
trients for the first four to six 
months for most infants. When 
the nursing mother is healthy and 
well fed, fluoride and possibly vi­
tamin D may be the only supple­
ments which need to be provided 
to the infant. Iron may also be 
given after about four months. 173 

Because the decision to breast­
feed or not is the result of many 
factors - including education, cul­
tural background, and personal­
ity-information about breast­
feeding should be included in nu­
trition and sex education in 
schools.174 175 This information 
and education should also be pro­
vided for boys because the hus­
band's attitudes are important in 
successful lactation.176 177 

There is also a need for all phy­
sicians to become much more 
knowledgeable about infant nutri­
tion and the physiology, value, 
and technique of breastfeeding. 
Education about breastfeeding 
should be directed to the under­
graduate curriculum of physi­

cians and nurses and to the resi­
dency training program of obste­
tricians and pediatricians. 

The routine in many hospitals 
makes breastfeeding difficult; 
therefore, efforts should be made 
to change obstetrical ward and 
neonatal unit practices to in­
crease the opportunity for suc­
cessfullactation. Changes may in­
clude the following: 

1. Decrease the amount of se­
dation and/or anesthesia given to 
the mother during labor and de­
livery because large amounts can 
impair suckling in the infant.178 

2. A void separation of the 
mother from her infant during the 
first 24 hours. 

3. Breastfeed infants on an "on 
demand" schedule rather than on 
a rigid three- to four-hour sched­
ule, and discourage routine sup­
plementary formula feedings. 

4. Reappraise physical facil­
ities to provide easy access of the 
mother to her infant. Rooming-in 
of mother and infant is important 
to successful lactation. 

Many women require encour­
agement to foster the "milk ejec­
tion reflex"179; therefore, the per­
sonnel involved in the care of 
pregnant women and new moth­
ers should be psychologically ori­
ented toward breastfeeding and 
should be well informed about the 
preparation of the breasts, lacta­
tion, and the management of 
breastfeeding. Nursing personnel 
with personal experience in 
breastfeeding can be extremely 
helpful.180 In addition, mothers 
should be taught the details of 
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breastfeeding during prenatal 
classes as well as during the post­
partum period. Consultation be­
tween maternity services and 
members of La Leche League In­
ternational (9616 Minneapolis 
Avenue, Franklin Park, IL 60131) 
or the Human Lactation Center 
Ltd. (666 Sturgis Highway, West­
port, CT 06880) may be helpful in 
encouraging breastfeeding. 

The availability of infant for­
mulas and other infant foods has 
influenced infant feeding prac­
tices throughout the world. 
Apathy and lack of knowledge 
about infant nutrition by health 
professionals and the medical pro­
fession have been important prob­
lems. Effective and, at times, un­
fair pUblicity of formula-feeding, 
lack of financial support from 
governments in developing coun­
tries, and the need for many wom­
en to work outside the home have 
also been contributory factors. 
These factors have resulted in a 
decrease in breastfeeding in sec­
tions of society where formula use 
may not be suitable.181-184 Breast­
feeding along with provision of in­
expensive "multi-mix" weaning 
foods have been suggested as two 
immediate priorities in develop­
ing countries. Also, supplies of in­
fant formulas similar in nutrition­
al quality to breast milk must be 
available for infants who cannot 
breastfeed; particular care must 
be paid to ensure safe water and 
sanitary conditions for mothers 
using these formulas. 

Many women in both industri­
alized and developing countries 

BREASTFEEDING 

now work outside the home, ei­
ther for economic or personal rea­
sons. Increasing numbers of mar­
ried women have a full-time ca­
reer that they are either reluctant 
or unable to give up. Therefore, it 
is recommended that countries 
adopt legislation to enable new 
mothers to obtain three to four 
months of leave after delivery to 
care for their infants. In addition, 
studies need to be carried out to 
determine whether it is feasible or 
practical for mothers to continue 
to breastfeed their infants - pos­
sibly in day nurseries adj acent to 
places of work - after returning to 
work. 

SUMMARY 

1. Full-term newborn infants 
should be breastfed, except if 
there are specific contraindica­
tions or when breastfeeding is un­
successful. 

2. Education about breastfeed­
ing should be provided in schools 
for all children, and better educa­
tion about breastfeeding and in­
fant nutrition should be provided 
in the curriculum of physicians 
and nurses. Information about 
breastfeeding should also be pre­
sented in public communications 
media. 

3. Prenatal instruction should 
include both theoretical and prac­
tical information about breast­
feeding. 

4. Attitudes and practices in 
prenatal clinics and in maternity 
wards should encourage a climate 
which favors breastfeeding. The 
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staff should include nurses and 
other personnel who are not only 
favorably disposed toward breast­
feeding but also knowledgeable 
and skilled in the art. 

5. Consultation between mater­
nity services and agencies com­
mitted to breastfeeding should be 
strengthened. 

6. Studies should be conducted 
on the feasibility of breastfeeding 
infants at day nurseries adjacent 
to places of work subsequent to 
an appropriate leave of absence 
following the birth of an infant. 
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Editor's Comment: 
The joint statement in support of 

breastfeeding, a long time in coming, 
marks a major advance for the pedi­
atric establishment. For over half a 
century, pediatricians were fixed in 
their belief that man-made formulas 
were as good as nature's formula. 
Further. they viewed nursing unbefit­
ting to the emancipated woman. 
When La Leche League. a mothers' 
organization formed in 1956. initiated 
a countercurrent to help mothers ea­
ger to breastfeed to succeed. pediatri­
cians unhesitatingly branded LLL 
mothers fanatics. 

Unfortunately, the physician's 
training and experience does not fos­
ter an understanding of nature's in­
herent wisdom, nor an appreciation of 
nature's authoritative voice, the re­
sult of time-tested evolutionary pro­
cesses. The physician, therefore, dis­
regards the obvious messages and 
norms of nature. He usurps nature's 
authority and brashly intervenes in 
natural mechanisms and processes. 
This opacity to nature - and its effect 
-is particularly apparent in obstet­
rics and pediatrics because these spe­
cialties deal primarily with the 
healthy. It results, to use an old in­
dictment, in meddlesome obstetrics 
and meddlesome pediatrics. 

The mass move to bottIe feeding. 

spurred on by good home refrigera­
tion, accelerated in the twenties when 
weight gain was singled out as the 
prime parameter of infant health and 
development, and the scale became 
the focus of the office visit. If physi­
cians understood nature, they would 
know that nature uses multipurpose 
mechanisms. To restrict progress to 
weight gain, important though it is, is 
insufficient. The joint statement im­
pressively covers the many pluses of 
breast milk and breastfeeding. 

The thinking and habits of pediatri­
cians will not change overnight. It 
may take more than a generation be­
fore breastfeeding replaces bottle 
feeding. The reasons are many. The 
medical profession's experience with 
bottle feeding is long, its experience 
with successful breastfeeding very 
short. Given the slightest difficulty, 
pediatricians quickly switch .to bottle 
feeding just as contemporary obste­
tricians, faced with even minor diffi­
culties in parturition, switch to ce­
sareans. Neither, thereby, learns to 
handle the common difficulties that 
arise in the transition from intrauter­
ine to extrauterine life. The joint 
statement is a necessary step on the 
road to viewing nature as an ally. 
Those interested in the promotion of 
breastfeeding are thankful for it. HR 
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SAMUEL L. BLUMENFELD 

Motherhood: A Proud 
Profession 

FIRST, I WANT to say how de­
lighted I am to be here. I was truly 
honored by your invitation to ad­
dress you. After all, is there a 
more important audience than 
this one? I think not, for without 
mothers, can there possibly be 
any future at all for the human 
race, let alone this country? Sec­
ond, I have a confession to make. 
I really don't like the title of my 
speech. After all, to think of 
motherhood simply as a profes­
sion or to compare it to a career is, 
I think, to shortchange it. Moth­
erhood is much more: it is at the 
very heart of life; and the mother­
child relationship is the inner 
sanctum of life's mysteries. Also, 
I am very wary of the word proud. 
Of course, I can understand a 
woman's pride in bearing and rais­
ing her children. But too much 
pride can lead to unrealistic ex­
pectations. It can sometimes be­
come a barrier to love, which re­
quires much more humility than 
pride. 

Also, the phrase "proud profes­
sion" smacks of our having to jus­
tify motherhood, and only a luna­
tic society would have to do that. 
And I'm sure that all of you would 

agree that we don't live in a luna­
tic society- or do we? I don't 
know. Yet, it is a strange irony 
that this organization and this 
convention have had to come into 
existence in the first place. It's as 
if we had to create an organiza­
tion to encourage people to re­
main human. 

Apparently, there are a lot of 
people in this world who do not 
want to be as God created them. 
They want to be some product of 
technology, a mechanical being 
programmed to fit in with com­
puters, jumbo jets, cars, frozen 
foods, and pills. The pills are sup­
posed to liberate us from our emo­
tional, instinctual, and spiritual 
needs so that we can conveniently 
mesh with all of the technological 
contrivances around us. It is a de­
humanizing process which start­
ed in the last century when man 
discovered the uses, or I should 
say the misuses, of scientific tech­
nology. It is a dehumanizing pro­
cess that has been accelerated 
greatly in the last thirty years, 
making it virtually impossible for 
our newer generations to know 
what being human is. It is a pro­
cess which must be stopped and 
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reversed unless we wish to de­
stroy ourselves. 

During 1974, when I was writ­
ing The Retreat from Mother­
hood, I found myself becoming 
very pessimistic about the future. 
So much of what I found out 
about the women's liberation 
movement, the increase in pre­
marital sex, the widespread prac­
tice of abortion, child abuse, the 
epidemic of divorce, the porno­
graphic explosion, the anti-mater­
nalism of our educational system, 
the increasing suicide rate among 
the young made me feel that the 
situation was quite hopeless. And 
then I found out about La Leche 
League, and I thought that per­
haps here is the beginning of the 
way back to sanity. It was the 
only positive ray of light I found 
in that vast darkness, but it was a 
strong ray. Indeed, it was strong 
enough to lift me out of my pessi­
mism. I was particularly encour­
aged by the fact that, despite all 
of the trends in the opposite direc­
tion, the League has grown re­
markably since its founding in 
1956, and that the idea of breast­
feeding has become much more 
acceptable among young moth­
ers. Part of this, I suppose, is due 
to the back-to-nature movement 
among the young, and part of it, I 
believe, is the result of a healthy 
rebellion against dehumanizing 
technology . 

Let me say at the outset that I 
am not against technology per se. 
SAMUEL L. BLUMENFELD, Boston, 
MA, a former book and magazine editor, 
is the author of several books. 

I have no objection to any techno­
logical advance that enhances 
life. But technology has always 
been a two-edged sword, capable 
of doing both good and harm. 
And unless we know or learn how 
to maximize its benefits and mini­
mize its harms, we shall not know 
how to use technology. For exam­
ple, amniocentesis was invented 
by a doctor in New Zealand as a 
means of tapping the fluid in the 
amnio sac during pregnancy to 
see if the prenatal infant required 
treatment in utero prior to its 
birth. Its purpose was to save the 
life of an endangered prenatal in­
fant. But this same technique has 
been adapted by other doctors to 
perform saline abortions which 
kill perfectly healthy prenatal in­
fants. Thus, the sword is indeed 
double-edged. Yet, some social 
scientists would say that the sec­
ond use was just as humanitarian 
as the first. I'll let you be the 
judge of that. 

Another example. Dr. Albert 
Einstein, the great humanitarian 
physicist, discovered the princi­
ples of nuclear energy. But the 
way man first made practical use 
of them was by destroying two 
Japanese cities. So we must al­
ways be on guard where technol­
ogy is concerned, particularly 
where technology removes man 
from what is natural to him, and 
where technology is applied with­
out sufficient knowledge. For 
example, there is the recently re­
ported case of the maternity clin­
ics that routinely subjected about 
four million newborn babes to a 
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high dose of radiation in the 
1940's and 1950's because it was 
believed that such treatment 
would eliminate the need for fu­
ture tonsillectomies. But today it 
has been discovered that these 
grown up individuals are now sus­
ceptible to cancer of the thyroid 
because of that supposedly be­
nign dose of radiation. 

Man's intrusions 

The fields of pediatrics and ob­
stetrics, I'm afraid, are full of that 
same kind of mindle,ss application 
of technology with surprisingly 
little concern about future ramifi­
cations. Entire hospital proce­
dures have been developed that 
have made of childbirth a techno­
logical nightmare, transforming a 
natural process into a hospital 
sickness in which everything is 
done to place as much emotional 
distance between mother and 
newborn infant as possible. The 
fact is that modern obstetrics and 
pediatrics are the children of mod­
ern technology. They are man's 
intrusions into God's processes. 

I know it is no longer fashion­
able to talk about God. It's all 
right to believe in astrology or the 
occult, but mention God in edu­
cated or so-called enlightened cir­
cles, and you get back very pecu­
liar vibrations. They either think 
you're a religious fanatic, a primi­
tive fundamentalist, or a political 
reactionary. They simply will not 
take the idea of God seriously, 
and they consider anyone who 
does as someone fit for psychi-

MOTHERHOOD 

atric treatment or commitment to 
a mental institution. And it is 
these secular humanists, as they 
call themselves, who today total­
ly dominate science and technol­
ogy. They consider themselves 
the guardians of rationality and 
they consider religionists as basi­
cally irrational. 

They see motherhood as a pro­
ductive but limited and inferior 
role in society, to be managed by 
the scientific principles of behav­
ioral psychology and subordinat­
ed to the policies of government 
planning. I see motherhood quite 
differently. I see it as a manifesta­
tion of God's will for both mother 
and child. I see motherhood as the 
result of God's technology, not 
man's. The miracle of birth ex­
ceeds anything man has ever done 
or will ever do. All you have to do 
is observe what happens from the 
moment of conception to the birth 
of a unique human being nine 
months later to realize how really 
puny man's achievements are in 
comparison. 

But man's pride is insatiable 
and he must denigrate God's 
achievements in order to elevate 
his own. And he does this by 
denying the sacredness of God's 
creation and treating the unborn 
child like so much fetal tissue. 
Make no mistake about it, a true 
respect for life is impossible with­
out a belief in its Creator. And 
that is the basic issue that sepa­
rates religionists from secular hu­
manists. 

There were about a million 
abortions in America last year, all 
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in the name of rational family 
planning. These perfectly healthy 
prenatal infants were killed be­
cause they were unwanted. Un­
wanted by whom? By their par­
ents. Think of it, such a terrible 
denial of all that is sacred to the 
human heart and conscience, all 
for the sake of personal conve­
nience, sexual enjoyment, and so­
cial advantage. And both our le­
gal and medical systems have 
been perverted to accommodate 
this silent carnage. Ms. Gloria 
Steinem was terribly upset some 
months ago when the Congress 
voted against the use of federal 
funds to pay for the abortions of 
poor women. She could not under­
stand why a very large number of 
American taxpayers did not want 
to become accomplices in what 
can only be described as mass 
murder. And Ms. Steinem is a 
shining example of a secular hu­
manist in action. 

It is fortunate for us that the 
people who first settled this coun­
try and created the United States 
were anything but secular human­
ists. They were, for the most part, 
Calvinists, profoundly religious, 
fearful of God, and ever mindful 
of man's depraved, sinful nature. 
They were so wary and distrust­
ful of human nature that they cre­
ated a Constitution and a form of 
government that would minimize 
man's capability of inflicting tyr­
anny on his fellowman. 

Now if you wish to understand 
secular humanism - the philoso­
phy currently predominant among 
America's intellectuals, educa­

tors, natural and social scientists 
- you have to understand that 
it not only rejected the Calvin­
ist view of man but also the en­
tire concept of a God-centered 
universe. The universe of the sec­
ular humanist is man-centered, 
and man, they tell us, is not by na­
ture depraved. He is not the sinful 
descendant of Adam and Eve. On 
the contrary, he is basically be­
nevolent, rational, and perfect­
ible. He is, some of them say with­
out modesty, even Godlike. But if 
man is so wonderful, one asks, 
why does he commit so much 
evil? Why have we seen in our 
own lifetime such devastating 
warfare, such atrocities, so much 
violent crime, so much mayhem? 
The secular humanists have been 
studying the problem for at least 
the last one hundred years under 
the heading of "psychology" and 
they've theorized that men do evil 
because of poverty, ignorance, so­
cial injustice, racial and religious 
prejudice, lack of adequate educa­
tion, poor housing and other en­
vironmental factors, sexual frus­
tration, abusive treatment in 
childhood and. of course, faulty 
upbringing by their mothers. So 
in the minds of some social scien­
tists, mothers have fallen under 
suspicion as being a prime cause 
of evil. 

Like psychology, modem pedi­
atrics is a child of modem science, 
and it emerged in the 1880's as 
one of the new medical special­
ties. Its first practitioners were 
male doctors who thought they 
could apply scientific principles 
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to the rearing of infants. The man 
who is most credited with having 
founded modern pediatrics is Dr. 
Luther Emmett Holt, who re­
ceived his doctor's degree in 1880, 
after which he worked at the New 
York Infant Asylum. In1887, the 
Babies Hospital of New York was 
founded and a year later Holt was 
appointed its director. Under his 
leadership, the hospital grew and 
became quite well known; its pro­
cedures became the standard for 
the field. In 1894 Holt published 
his Care and Feeding of Children. 
The success of this book was un­
paralleled in medical publication. 
It ran through more than 75 
printings, was translated into 
three languages, and made Holt's 
name a household word. 

The book was written in the 
form of questions and answers, 
and here is a sample of some of 
Dr. Holt's advice: 

How can a baby be taught to 
be regular in habits of eating 
and sleeping? 

By always feeding at regular 
intervals and putting to sleep 
at exactly the same time every 
day and evening. 

When should regular train­
ing be begun? 

During the first week of life. 
Should a baby be wakened to 

be nursed or fed if sleeping 
quietly? 

Yes, for a few days. This will 
not be required long, for reg­
ular feeding soon teaches an in­
fant to awaken regularly for his 
meal almost upon the minute. 
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Should children during the 
3rd and 4th years be fed be­
tween meals? 

Under no circumstances 
should anything but water be 
given. between the regular 
meals. 

Should a child sleep in the 
same bed with its mother or 
nurse? 

Under no circumstances if 
this can possibly be avoided; 
nor should older children sleep 
together. 

At what age mayan infant 
go all night without feeding? 

At five months a child 
should not be fed or nursed be­
tween 10 p.m. and 7 a.m. At 
one year a child will usually go 
from 7 p.m. to 7 a.m. without 
feeding or nursing. 

Is rocking necessary? 
By no means. It is a habit 

easily acquired, but hard to 
break, and a very useless and 
sometimes injurious one. 

When is crying useful? 
In the newly born infant the 

cry expands the lungs, and it is 
necessary that it should be re­
peated for a few minutes every 

. day in order to keep them well 
expanded. 

How much crying is normal 
for a very young baby? 

From 15 to 30 minutes a day. 
What is the nature of this 

cry? 
It is loud and strong. Infants 

get red in the face with it; in 
fact, it is a scream. This is nec­
essary for health. It is the 
baby's exercise. 
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What is the cry of indulgence 
or from habit? 

This is often heard even in 
very young infants, who cry to 
be rocked, to be carried about, 
sometimes for a light in the 
room, for a bottle to suck, or 
for the continuance of any oth­
er bad habit which has been ac­
quired. 

How can we be sure that a 
child is crying to be indulged? 

If it stops immediately when 
it gets what it wants, and cries 
when it is withdrawn or with­
held. 

How is an infant to be man­
aged that cries from temper or 
to be indulged? 

It should simply be allowed 
to cry it out. A second struggle 
is rarely necessary. 

At what age may playing 
with babies be begun? 

Never until four months, and 
better not until six months. 
The less of it at any time the 
better for the infant. 

What harm is done by play­
ing with very young babies? 

They are made nervous and 
irritable, sleep badly, and suf­
fer in other respects. 

What are the most common 
bad habits of children? 

Sucking, nail-biting, bed-wet­
ting, and masturbation. 

What should be done when 
one of these habits is discov­
ered? 

The fact should be brought 
immediately to the notice of 
the mother and physician, and 
every means taken to break up 

the habit while the child is 
young and before it becomes 
deeply seated. 

In the case of sucking or nail­
biting confining the hands to 
the sides during sleep or the 
wearing of mittens will often 
succeed if persisted in. On no 
account should the habit of 
sucking be allowed as a means 
of putting children to sleep or 
to quiet them while restless or 
suffering from indigestion. 

Masturbation is the most in­
jurious of all these habits, and 
should be broken up just as 
early as possible. Children 
should especially be watched at 
the time of going to sleep and 
on first waking. Punishments 
are of little avail and usually 
make matters worse. Medical 
advice should at once be sought. 

I wonder what mothers did dur­
ing the thousands of years before 
there were pediatricians? How did 
they know what to do before Dr. 
Holt came along? As you prob­
ably suspect, Dr. Holt, who domi­
nated the field of pediatrics dur­
ing his long career, was a pioneer 
in getting mothers to switch from 
breastfeeding to bottle feeding. 
Bottle feeding fitted in so much 
better with the scientific way of 
doing things. In a way, Holt 
wanted to turn mothers into pedi­
atricians, for everything he did 
was calculated to create the same 
kind of distance between mother 
and child as existed between pedi­
atrician and child. Holt also urged 
mothers to get rid of the cradle. 
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Infants enjoyed rocking too much 
and anything a child enjoyed that 
much had to be bad. And in just a 
few years time, the millions of 
cradles in American homes were 
discarded for the flat, stationary 
crib. 

For thousands of years the cra­
dle had been used because it was 
found that infants were soothed 
by a gentle rocking motion. After 
all, for the first nine months of 
life, an infant is in constant mo­
tion within its mother's body. 
And even when its mother is 
asleep, it is aware of the rhythmic 
heartbeat and the occasional 
movements that even a sleeping 
person makes. One pediatrician, 
Dr. John Zahorsky, who was criti­
cal of the wholesale abolition of 
the cradle, wrote an article about 
the cradle's benefits in 1934. He 
observed that the cradle's motion 
acted as a gentle fan. It was also 
soporific and soothed an excited 
nervous system. But an even 
greater benefit, he argued, was its 
aid to the infant's digestion. He 
wrote: 

The intestine always con­
tains gas, and the swinging 
movements of its body causes 
the liquid chyle to gravitate 
backward and forward over the 
intestinal mucosa. Rocking, 
therefore, is a physical therapy 
which aids digestion and prob­
ably absorption. 

According to the good doctor, the 
motion of the cradle was able 
to relieve the infant of certain 
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annoying digestive symptoms, 
which the stillness of the crib 
could not do. Once the symptoms 
were relieved, the infant could fall 
asleep. But Dr. Zahorsky's views 
went against the general trend, 
and his words fell on deaf ears. 
Pediatricians preferred to follow 
Dr. Holt down the scientific trail. 

Modern pediatrics revolution­
ized child care. Mother love, with 
its rocking and petting, billing 
and cooing, was identified and 
condemned as the indulger and 
spoiler of children, and therefore 
was to be studiously avoided. One 
noted pediatrician wrote in 1900, 
"An infant during the first year 
should neither be amusing nor 
amused." And Bessie Cutler, a pe­
diatric nurse wrote in her text­
book of 1927, "The child must 
never be rocked to sleep, given a 
pacifier or any soothing device." 
Is it any wonder that Americans 
turned to cigarette smoking by 
the millions to make up for the 
oral deprivation they suffered as 
children and to relieve the ten­
sions never relieved by soothing 
care? And is it any wonder that 
many mothers began to feel guil­
ty about their natural maternal 
impulses? I don't think it would 
be too rash to characterize Dr. 
Holt's pediatric philosophy as a 
subtle form of child abuse. 

At the turn of the century, this 
antimaternal philosophy of child 
care was so prevalent in children's 
hospitals, that many infants who 
were given the best scientifically 
approved care died from sheer ne­
glect. Without that important in­
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gredient of mother love, the in­
fants simply wasted away. What 
we learned from that very tragic 
experience was that infants have 
a very definite biological need for 
the stimulation that comes with 
mother love, and that unless this 
need is satisfied, normal growth 
is thwarted. 

Really, it's quite evident that a 
mother and child are made to in­
dulge each other to their heart's 
content. That is the nature of the 
relationship, and satisfaction is 
its sweet reward. In fact, that is 
the lesson that La Leche League 
has taught us all about breast­
feeding: that the mother gets as 
much emotional value out of it as 
the infant. Another thing we've 
learned is that there is a lot more 
to breastfeeding than feeding 
alone. The tactile experience is as 
important as the nourishment, if 
not more so. When being nursed, 
the infant learns to associate the 
feel, the warmth, the touch, and 
the smell of the mother with the 
taste and satisfaction of nourish­
ment. It is an experience that ap­
peals to and activates all of the 
senses. It encompasses a whole 
range of pleasant feelings. The 
mother, in her turn, also experi­
ences a similar range of physical, 
emotional, and psychological plea­
sures. In the course of a year, this 
marvelously harmonious relation­
ship forms the basis for a lifelong 
attachment. 

Today the favorite word is bond 
or bonding. I prefer to use the 
word attachment for a number of 
reasons. We talk of the bonds of 

friendship or the bonds of mar­
riage almost in the sense of physi­
cal ties that can be broken. But 
the word attachment implies a 
more emotional and spiritual tie, 
something more permanent than 
a bond. Let's face it. Friendships 
and marriages break up, but the 
attachment between mother and 
child endures a lifetime. It may 
undergo changes over the years, 
but it can never end. For many, 
this attachment will remain a life­
long anchor of emotional stabil­
ity. 

Incidentally, the truth of this 
was dramatically demonstrated 
to me not so long ago when I saw 
a TV show in which adopted chil­
dren, reunited with their real 
mothers, expressed the deep feel­
ings that compelled them to seek 
out their real mothers. As much 
as they loved and were attached 
to their adoptive parents. they re­
tained a special attachment to the 
mother who had given them up or 
abandoned them. 

A painful period 

The need for attachment is a 
lifelong need, and we first become 
acutely aware of this need in 
childhood. Every child between 
the age of eight and twenty-four 
months begins to experience a 
painful period of emotional 
growth and adjustment known as 
attachment behavior. From a psy­
chic point of view, it is as emo­
tionally painful as teething can be 
physically painful, but only more 
so. It is the most important ad-
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justment all children must make, 
and so I think it would be worth­
while to dwell on it for a few mo­
ments. 

The human infant is a complete­
ly dependent being for several 
years, and during'the first year of 
life he is the totally passive re­
ceiver of love and nourishment. 
He and his mother seem to be one. 
Then as he grows and gains the 
ability to move about, he becomes 
aware that he and his mother are 
not one but two entities and that 
the los80f mother is a possibility. 
He begins to feel an acute psychic 
pain known as separation anxi­
ety. How do we know he feels it? 
By his behavior. He clings to 
mother, follows her around, re­
quires constant reassurance of be­
ing loved - all in order to quell 
this painful separation anxiety. 
In fact, he acts very much like a 
passionate but highly insecure 
lover. Eventually he discovers 
that the best way to eliminate 
separation anxiety is to create an 
emotional tie by maintaining a 
permanent state of love between 
him and his mother. So from be­
ing a passive receiver of mother 
love, he learns to become an ac­
tive giver of filial love. This per­
mits the growing youngster to 
tolerate greater physical separa­
tion from mother without experi­
encing severe separation anxiety. 

But the threat of separation 
anxiety is always there. It can be 
caused not only by a fear of losing 
mother but also by the threat of 
being attracted away from moth­
er. And so the youngster in turn 
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develops filial loyalty. The very 
same problem exists among 
adults in marriage. Separation 
anxiety can be aroused by the fear 
of losing one's mate or of being at­
tracted away from one's mate. So 
we behave lovingly to keep our 
mates happy and develop monog­
amous loyalty to dampen our sex­
ual response to others. We do all 
of this because we need the at­
tachment. That is why so many 
bad and indifferent marriages en­
dure. Because the pain of separa­
tion can be far more intolerable 
than the pain of a bad attach­
ment. But obviously, a good at. 
tachment not only quells the neg­
ative pains of separation anxiety, 
but also provides a wide range of 
positive pleasures as well. 

The human being first encoun­
ters the problem of separation 
anxiety as a small child. But it is 
a problem that remains with us 
throughout life. I am inclined to 
believe that separation anxiety is 
one of our emotional reflexes, an 
intrinsic part of our biological 
makeup, a survival instinct. For 
the separation from mother in 
primitive circumstances meant 
sure death. Without separation 
anxiety the highly dependent 
small child might wander too far 
from mother and be killed. Hu­
man beings have a weak sense of 
smell. We don't run fast. Our 
muscles are comparatively weak. 
Our survival depends on strong, 
intense emotions that link us with 
other protecting human beings. 

So there is far more to the 
mother-child relationship than 
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Dr. Holt ever dreamed of. There is 
the need to be loved and the need 
to love. There is the need for the 
stability and security of attach­
ment and the need for the free­
dom and encouragement to grow. 
A wise mother must learn in some 
way how to satisfy all of these 
needs, and in the process she no 
doubt finds herself relying more 
and more on her intuition and in­
stincts than on her pediatrician. 

Now mothers must get over the 
idea that their job is to produce 
perfect children. There is no such 
thing as a perfect child, for hu­
man beings are not perfectible. 
Besides, no two parents would 
agree on what a perfect child is. 
But apparently many of you are 
quite aware of this, for there was 
an interesting session this morn­
ing about the myth of the Super 
Mom entitled, "Now I'm a Leader: 
Why Aren't My Children Per­
fect?" The wise mother learns 
quite early that her child is a sep­
arate human being whose ulti­
mate destiny is in God's hands, 
not hers, and no amount of pedi­
atric experimentation will ever 
change this. The most that any 
mother can do is simply instill in 
her child a sense of trust, con­
stancy, and harmony, and hope 
for the best. 

So intuitive an art 

It is because motherhood is so 
intuitive an art that I consider it 
a calling rather than a profession. 
It is a calling which God has lim­
ited to women alone, and to whom 

He gave instincts suitable to cope 
with it. We have been told by 
modern scientists that there is no 
such thing as a maternal instinct, 
that mothering is a learned pat­
tern of behavior. I don't think it 
is. I think that if a young mother 
and a small infant were left alone 
on a deserted island, she would 
know instinctively how to care for 
the child. I think that modern so­
ciety has simply made it impos­
sible for many women to feel their 
own maternal instincts. I think 
that modern pediatrics has made 
many young mothers afraid that 
they may be doing the wrong 
thing. It is part of the whole dehu­
manizing process. 

We have been told a great deal 
about man's brain-his rational­
ity - as being his primary tool of 
survival. I differ with this view. 
Man's brain is merely a tool of 
survival, a tool that applies more 
to his adult situation than his 
childhood one. His instincts and 
emotions are far more important 
to him, particularly during his 
early years, and only a mother 
can suitably respond to them. 
That's her special insight. That's 
what makes the qualitative differ­
ence between a man and a woman. 
She is made to respond to instinc­
tual and emotional need. And 
that is why male pediatricians 
like Dr. Holt, with all their scien­
tific know-how, were so far off 
base. 

The tendency in these egalitar­
ian days is to minimize the differ-~ 
ences between men and women. 
In fact, we are in danger of mini-
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mizing them out of existence. But 
the truth is that these differences 
are far more important than the 
women's libbers would permit us 
to believe. Moreover, it is quite 
significant that these differences, 
for the most part, involve chil­
dren. First, only a woman can ac­
tually bear a new human being in 
her body. A man cannot do so, no 
matter how much he may wish to. 
Second, only a woman can nurse a 
child with her own body. True, a 
man can feed an infant with a bot­
tle, but you and I know that that 
is not the same as breastfeeding. 
Third, only a woman can experi­
ence the symbiotic mother-child 
attachment with its great inten­
sity in the early years and its sat­
isfying emotional and spiritual 
aspects in the later years. In 
short, only a woman has that spe­
cial capacity - both physical and 
emotional- to relate to her chil­
dren in a way that is biologically 
denied men. 

And don't for a moment think 
that men to some degree have not 
envied women their special capa­
bilities. Yet, the psychologists 
have cleverly reversed the situa­
tion, giving the impression that it 
is the women who envy the men, 
and not vice versa. I suppose God 
was kind enough to permit men 
some compensatory pleasures 
and interests which made up for 
his limited biological function 
and complemented, in a paternal 
and husbandly way, what women 
were able to do in a maternal way. 
It is a marvelous division of labor 
based on biological realities. It 
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doesn't mean that a woman can­
not become a truck driver or an 
architect if she wants to. But it 
does mean that a man cannot be­
come a mother no matter how 
many Equal Rights Amendments 
are added to the Constitution. 
God is not an egalitarian, and 
that is why the secular humanists 
resent Him so, and that is why 
they want to remake the human 
race to accord with their own pe­
culiar notions of social justice. 
That's what dehumanization is all 
about. To be human is simply to 
be as God made us. 

Which brings me to a most im­
portant issue. There is a danger in 
America that with all of our em­
phasis on family planning, par­
ents are losing sight of what par­
enting means. Because technol­
ogy has now given us the power 
to determine whether an unborn 
child is to live or die, some par­
ents have decided to usurp God's 
role. For example, there are some 
pregnant women who will ask 
their doctors for an amniocentesis 
on the pretext that they want to 
determine if their unborn child is 
afflicted with some dreaded ab­
normality. Actually, what they 
really want to know is the sex of 
the child so that they can decide 
whether or not to abort it. I'd hate 
to be the child of parents who 
made such a life-and-death deci­
sion on such a cruel and arbitrary 
basis. A child born to such par­
ents under such conditions would 
be expected to be what his par­
ents wanted him to be, and not 
what he himself might want to be. 
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In denying God's will, the parents 
also deny the child's own personal 
destiny. Such parents are inca­
pable of the unselfish and uncon­
ditional love that all children 
need. To such parents children are 
wanted for what they can give the 
parents, and not vice versa. The 
child is indeed a "wanted" child, 
but he is wanted for all the wrong 
reasons. 

If motherhood is a sacred call­
ing, as I believe it to be, it is be­
cause a mother must also be pre­
pared to accept the heartbreak of 
a sick child, a deformed child, a 
child who may one day go astray. 
Everyone has to have a mother, 
the good and the bad, the saved 
and the damned, the ugly and the 
beautiful, the idiot and the ge­
nius, the success and the failure. 
That is why it helps a mother to 
believe in God, so that she can ac­
cept with serenity God's plan and 
thereby, through the power of her 
own love and faith, transform 
misfortune into blessing. 

The happy mother is not the 
woman who fights God's will but 
who submits to it and enjoys its 
pleasures and satisfactions. She 
responds to the calling of mother­
hood, aware of its inherent sanc­
tity. She knows that she is more 
than a breeder. She knows that in 
passing life on to the next genera­
tion, she is passing the torch of 
humankind forward. She also 
knows that motherhood is an art, 
not a science, because human be­
ings are not produced on an as­
sembly line like mechanical dolls. 
Each child is unique, an individ­

ual, a work of divine creation. 
And each mother-child relation­
ship has its own special qualities, 
created by the interrelationship of 
two unique human beings, one 
helpless and dependent, the other 
loving and caring. So motherhood 
is both a calling and an art and it 
demands of a woman everything 
that is good in her: affection, gen­
tleness, understanding, patience, 
playfulness, as well as firmness, 
restraint, endurance, courage, 
constancy, and sacrifice. A child 
who drinks at the fountain of such 
goodness cannot help but grow up 
loving and revering his mother, 
and experiencing a great zest for 
life. 

Life's wonderful potential 

To sum it up, let me say that 
motherhood is a marvelous oppor­
tunity for a woman to convey to 
her child the idea of life's wonder­
ful potential. Some months ago, 
when Bette Davis, one of Holly­
wood's greatest stars, was hon­
ored by a television special that 
reviewed her remarkable career, 
she stood before that great, glam­
orous, and sophisticated audience 
at the end of the show and paid 
tribute to the one great influence 
in her life, without which her en­
tire career would have been im­
possible: her mother, Ruthie. 
There was a mother-daughter re­
lationship that transcended all 
difficulties and survived all of 
life's uncertainties, and it was a 
moving experience to hear that fa­
mous woman recalling the impor-
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tance of mother love in the midst 
of all that plastic and celluloid 
technology. Without mother love, 
none of it would have ever hap­
pened. 

In this century, where we focus 
so much of our attention and 
hopes on romantic and sexual 
love, we tend to forget that moth­
er love is a far greater sustainer of 
life in the long run. And when we 
do achieve happiness in adult­
hood with our mates and our chil­
dren, we know how much we owe 
to our mothers for what they did 
for us, for what they taught us, 
for what they were to us. This is a 
theme that runs throughout our 
lives. And when it is time for a hu­
man being to leave this earth, 
how often do we hear in that final 
whisper, the very first word we 
ever learned to speak: Mama? 

My own mother died in 1960, 

and every day I think of her in 
some way. She was a simple im­
migrant woman who mothered 
five children without ever having 
read Dr. Holt. She accepted God's 
calling whenever it came. The 
idea of killing an unborn child was 
anathema to her. I derived more 
pure love and joy from her than 
from any other human being. And 
I didn't have to do very much to 
get it - just be born. How blessed 
I was. And that, in a nutshell, is 
what a mother can do for a child 
that nobody else can do: permit 
him or her to experience the full 
sense of God's benevolent power 
and blessing. 

And so, I will very appropriate­
ly end by saying God bless you 
all, and God bless La Leche 
League, and - oh yes, one last 
thing - please bring back the cra­
ilie! 0 

Presented at the Sixth Biennial Convention of La Leche League International, 

Toronto, July 14-16, 1977. 


Editor's Comment: 
Our admiration for B. continues un- less application of technology with 
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knows that she is more than a breed- searcher finds the scientific justifica­
er. She knows that in passing life on tion for what she has been doing all 
to the next generation, she is passing along." Incidentally, B. is a great pro­
the torch of humankind forward"; we lifer, and a great banquet speaker. 
must be on guard against the "mind- Prolifers please take note. HR 

MOTHERHOOD 275 



OLIVER WENDELL HOLMES 

The Contagiousness of 
Puerperal Fever*t 

THE POINT AT ISSUE 

The Affirmative 

The disease known as Puer­
peral Fever is so far contagious 
as to be frequently carried from 
patient to patient by physi­
cians and nurses. - O. W. 
Holmes, 1843. 

The Negative 

The result of the whole dis­
cussion will, I trust, serve, not 
only to exalt your views of the 
value and dignity of our profes­
sion, but to divest your minds 
of the overpowering dread that 
you can ever become, especial­
ly to woman, under the ex­
tremely interesting circum­
stances of gestation and par­
turition, the minister of evil; 
that you can ever convey, in 
any possible manner, a horrible 
virus, so destructive in its ef­

*Printed in 1843; reprinted with addi­

tions, 1855. 

tTo be published in two parts. 


fects, and SO mysterious in its 
operations as that attributed 
to puerperal fever.-Professor 
Hodge, 1852. 

I prefer to attribute them to 
accident, or Providence, of 
which I can form a conception, 
rather than to a contagion of 
which I cannot form any clear 
idea, at least as to this par­
ticular malady. -Professor 
Meigs, 1852. 

. .. in the propagation of 
which they have no more to do, 
than with the propagation of 
cholera from Jessore to San 
Francisco, and from Mauritius 
to St. Petersburg. - Professor 
Meigs, 1854. 

I arrived at that certainty in 
the matter, that I could ven­
ture to foretell what women 
would be affected with the dis­
ease, upon hearing by what 
midwife they were to be deliv­
ered, or by what nurse they 
were to be attended, during 
their lying-in; and, almost in 
every instance, my prediction 
was verified. - Gordon, 1795. 
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A certain number of deaths 
is caused every year by the con­
tagion of puerperal fever, com­
municated by the nurses and 
medical attendants. - Farr, in 
Fifth Annual Report of Regis­
trar-General ofEngland, 1843 . 

. . . boards of health, if such 
exist, or, without them, the 
medical institutions of a coun­
try, should have the power of 
coercing, or of inflicting some 
kind of punishment on those 
who recklessly go from cases of 
puerperal fevers to parturient 
or puerperal females, without 
using aue precaution; and who, 
having been shown the risk, 
criminally encounter it, and 
convey pestilence and death to 
the persons they are employed 
to aid in the most interesting 
and suffering period of female 
existence. - Copland's Medical 
Dictionary, Art. Puerperal 
States and Diseases, 1852. 

We conceive it unnecessary 
to go into detail to prove the 
contagious nature of this dis­
ease, as there are few, if any, 
American practitioners who do 
not believe in this doctrine.­
Dr. Lee, in Additions to Article 
last cited. 

[INTRODUCTORY NOTE.] It hap­
pened, some years ago, that a dis­
cussion arose in a Medical Society 
OLIVER WENDELL HOLMES, Har­
vard University School of Medicine Pro­
fessor, was an influential 19th century 
medical essayist, and the father of Chief 
Justice Oliver Wendell Holmes. 
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of which I was a member, involv­
ing the subject of a certain sup­
posed cause of disease, about 
which something was known, a 
good deal suspected, and not a lit­
tle feared. The discussion was 
suggested by a case, reported at 
the preceding meeting, of a physi­
cian who made an examination of 
the body of a patient who had 
died with puerperal fever, and 
who himself died in less than a 
week, apparently in consequence 
of a wound received at the exami­
nation, having attended several 
women in confinement in the 
meantime, all of whom, as it was 
alleged, were attacked with puer­
peral fever. 

Whatever apprehensions and 
beliefs were entertained, it was 
plain that a fuller knowledge of 
the facts relating to the subject 
would be acceptable to all pres­
ent. I therefore felt that it would 
be doing a good service to look 
into the best records I could find, 
and inquire of the most trust­
worthy practitioners I knew, to 
learn what experience had to 
teach in the matter, and arrived 
at the results contained in the fol­
lowing pages. 

The Essay was read before the 
Boston Society for Medical Im­
provement, and, at the request of 
the Society, printed in the New 
England Quarterly Journal of 
Medicine and Surgery for April, 
1843. As this Journal never ob­
tained a large circulation, and 
ceased to be published after a 
year's existence, and as the few 
copies I had struck off separately 
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were soon lost sight of among the 
friends to whom they were sent, 
the Essay can hardly be said to 
have been fully brought before 
the Profession. 

The subject of this Paper has 
the same profound interest for me 
at the present moment as it had 
when I was first collecting the ter­
rible evidence out of which, as it 
seems to me, the commonest exer­
cise of reason could not help shap­
ing the truth it involved. It is not 
merely on account of the bearing 
of the question, - if there is a 
question, - on all that is most sa­
cred in human life and happiness, 
that the subject cannot lose its in­
terest. It is because it seems evi­
dent that a fair statement of the 
facts must produce its proper in­
fluence on a very large proportion 
of well-constituted and unpreju­
diced minds. Individuals may, 
here and there, resist the practical 
bearing of the evidence on their 
own feelings or interests; some 
may fail to see its meaning, as 
some persons may be found who 
cannot tell red from green; but I 
cannot doubt that most readers 
will be satisfied and convinced, to 
loathing, long before they have 
finished the dark obituary calen­
dar laid before them. 

I do not know that I shall ever 
again have so good an opportu­
nity of being useful as was grant­
ed me by the raising of the ques­
tion which produced this Essay. 
For I have abundant evidence 
that it has made many practi­
tioners more cautious in their re­
lations with puerperal females, 

and I have no doubt it will do so 
still, if it has a chance of being 
read, though it should callout a 
hundred counterblasts, proving 
to the satisfaction of their au­
thors that it proved nothing. And 
for my part, I had rather rescue 
one mother from being poisoned 
by her attendant, than claim to 
have saved forty out of fifty pa­
tients to whom I had carried the 
disease. Thus, I am willing to 
avail myself of any hint coming 
from without to offer this paper 
once more to the press. The occa­
sion has presented itself, . as will 
be seen, in a convenient if not in a 
flattering form. 

I send this Essay again to the 
MEDICAL PROFESSION. without 
the change of a word or syllable. I 
find, on reviewing it, that it antic­
ipates and eliminates those sec.­
ondary questions which cannot be 
entertained for a moment until 
the one great point of fact is pe­
remptorily settled. In its very 
statement of the doctrine main­
tained it avoids all discussion of 
the nature of the disease "known 
as puerperal fever," and all the 
somewhat ·stale philology of the 
word contagion. It mentions, fair­
ly enough, the names of sceptics, 
or unbelievers as to the reality of 
personal transmission; of Dewees, 
of Tonnelle, of Dugas, of Baude­
locque, and others; of course, not 
including those whose works were 
then unwritten or unpUblished; 
nor enumerating all the Continen­
tal writers who, in ignorance of 
the great mass of evidence accu-
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mulated by British practitioners, 
could hardly be called well in­
formed on this subject. It meets 
all the array of negative cases,­
those in which disease did not fol­
low exposure, - by the striking 
example of smallpox, which, al­
though one of· the most conta­
gious of diseases, is subject to the 
most remarkable irregularities 
and seeming caprices in its trans­
mission. It makes full allowance 
for other causes besides personal 
transmission, especially for epi­
demic influences. It allows for the 
possibility of different modes of 
conveyance of the destructive 
principle. It recognizes and sup­
ports the belief that a series of 
cases may originate from a single 
primitive source which affects 
each new patient in turn; and es­
pecially from cases of Erysipelas. 
It does not undertake to discuss 
the theoretical aspect of the sub­
ject; that is a secondary matter of 
consideration. Where facts are nu­
merous, and unquestionable, and 
unequivocal in their significance, 
theory must follow them as it 
best may, keeping time with their 
step, and not go before them, 
marching to the sound of its own 
drum and trumpet. Having thus 
narrowed its area to a limited 
practical platform of discussion, a 
matter of life and death, and not 
of phrases or theories, it covers 
every inch of it with a mass of evi­
dence which I conceive a Commit­
tee of Husbands, who can count 
coincidences and draw conclu­
sions as well as a Synod of Ac­
coucheurs, would justly consider 
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as affording ample reasons for an 
unceremonious dismissal of a 
practitioner (if it is conceivable 
that such a step could be waited 
for), after five or six funerals had 
marked the path of his daily vis­
its, while other practitioners were 
not thus escorted. To the Profes­
sion, therefore, I submit the paper 
in its original form, and leave it to 
take care of itself. 

To the MEDICAL STUDENTS, 
into whose hands this Essay may 
fall, some words of introduction 
may be appropriate. and perhaps, 
to a small number of them, neces­
sary. There are some among them 
who, from youth, or want of train­
ing, are easily bewildered and con­
fused in any conflict of opinions 
into which their studies lead 
them. They are liable to lose sight 
of the main question in collateral 
issues, and to be run away with 
by suggestive speculations. They 
confound belief with evidence, of­
ten trusting the first because it 
is expressed with energy, and 
slighting the latter because it is 
calm and unimpassioned. They 
are not satisfied with proof; they 
cannot believe a point is settled 
so long as everybody is not si­
lenced. They have not learned 
that error is got out of the minds 
that cherish it, as the taenia is re­
moved from the body, one joint, 
or a few joints at a time, for the 
most part, rarely the whole evil at 
once. They naturally have faith in 
their instructors, turning to them 
for truth, and taking what they 
may choose to give them; babes in 
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knowledge, not yet able to tell the 
breast from the bottle, pumping 
away for the milk of truth at all 
that offers, were it nothing better 
than a Professor's shrivelled fore­
finger. 

In the earliest and embryonic 
stage of professional develop­
ment, any violent impression on 
the instructor's mind is apt to be 
followed by some lasting effect on 
that of the pupil. No mother's 
mark is more permanent than the 
mental nevi and moles, and ex­
crescences, and mutilations, that 
students carry with them out of 
the lecture room, if once the 
teeming intellect which nourishes 
theirs has been scared from its 
propriety by any misshapen fan­
tasy. Even an impatient or petu­
lant expression, which to a philos­
opher would be a mere index of 
the low state of amiability of the 
speaker at the moment of its ut­
terance, may pass into the young 
mind as an element of its future 
constitution, to injure its temper 
or corrupt its judgment. It is a 
duty, therefore, which we owe to 
this younger class of students, to 
clear any important truth which 
may have been rendered question­
able in their minds by such lan­
guage, or any truth-teller against 
whom they may have been preju­
diced by hasty epithets, from the 
impressions such words have left. 
Until this is done, they are not 
ready for the question, where 
there is a question, for them to de­
cide. Even if we ourselves are the 
subjects of the prejudice, there 
seems to be no impropriety in 

showing that this prejudice is lo­
cal or personal, and not an ac­
knowledged conviction with the 
public at large. It may be neces­
sary to break through our usual 
habits of reserve to do this, but 
this is the fault of the position in 
which others have placed us. 

Two widely-known and highly­
esteemed practitioners, Profes­
sors in two of the largest Medical 
Schools of the Union, teaching 
the branch of art which includes 
the Diseases of Women, and 
therefore speaking with author­
ity; addressing in their lectures 
and printed publications large 
numbers of young men, many of 
them in the tenderest immaturity 
of knowledge, have recently taken 
ground in a formal way against 
the doctrine maintained in this 
paper.l The first of the two publi­
cations, Dr. Hodge's Lecture, 
while its theoretical consider­
ations and negative experiences 
do not seem to me to require any 
further notice than such as lay 
ready for them in my Essay writ­
ten long before, is, I am pleased to 
say, unobjectionable in tone and 
language, and may be read with­
out offense. 

This can hardly be said of the 
chapter of Dr. Meigs's volume 
which treats of Contagion in 
Childbed Fever. There ate expres­
sions used in it which might well 
put a stop to all scientific discus­
sions, were they to form the cur­
rent coin in our exchange of opin­
ions. I leave the "very young gen­
tlemen," whose careful exposi­
tions of the results of practice in 
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more than six thousand cases are 
characterized as "the jejune and 
fizenless dreamings of sophomore 
writers," to the sympathies of 
those "dear young friends," and 
"dear young gentlemen," who will 
judge how much to value their in­
structor's counsel to think for 
themselves, knowing what they 
are to expect if they happen not to 
think as he does. 

One unpalatable expression I 
suppose the laws of construction 
oblige me to appropriate to my­
self, as my reward for a certain 
amount of labor bestowed on the 
investigation of a very important 
question of evidence, and a state­
ment of my own practical conclu­
sions. I take no offense, and at­
tempt no retort. No man makes a 
quarrel with me over the counter­
pane that covers a mother, with 
her newborn infant at her breast. 
There is no epithet in the vocab­
ulary of slight and sarcasm that 
can reach my personal sensibil­
ities in such a controversy. Only 
just so far as a disrespectful 
phrase may turn the student 
aside from the examination of the 
evidence, by discrediting or dis­
honoring the witness, does it call 
for any word of notice. 

I appeal from the disparaging 
language by which the Professor 
in the Jefferson School of Phila­
delphia would dispose of my 
claims to be listened to. I appeal, 
not to the vote of the Society for 
Medical Improvement, although 
this was an unusual evidence of 
interest in the paper in question, 
for it was a vote passed among 
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my own townsmen; nor to the 
opinion of any American, for none 
know better than the Professors 
in the great Schools of Philadel­
phia how cheaply the praise of na­
tive contemporary criticism is ob­
tained. I appeal to the recorded 
opinions of those whom I do not 
know, and who do not know me, 
nor care for me, except for the 
truth that I may have uttered; to 
Copland, in his Medical Dic­
tionary, who has spoken of my 
Essay in phrases to which the 
pamphlets of American "scrib­
blers" are seldom used from Euro­
pean authorities; to Ramsbot­
ham, whose compendious eulogy 
is all that self-love could ask; to 
the Fifth Annual Report of the 
Registrar-General of England, in 
which the second-hand abstract 
of my Essay figures largely, and 
not without favorable comment, 
in an important appended paper. 
These testimonies, half forgotten 
until this circumstance recalled 
them, are dragged into the light, 
not in a paroxysm of vanity. but 
to show that there may be food 
for thought in the small pamphlet 
which the Philadelphia Teacher 
treats so lightly. They were at 
least unsought for, and would 
never have been proclaimed but 
for the sake of securing the priv­
ilege of a decent and unprejudiced 
hearing. 

I will take it for granted that 
they have so far counterpoised 
the depreciating language of my 
fellow-countryman and fellow­
teacher as to gain me a reader 
here and there among the youth· 
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ful class of students I am now ad­
dressing. It is only for their sake 
that I think it necessary to an­
alyze, or explain, or illustrate, or 
corroborate any portion of the fol­
lowing Essay. But I know that 
nothing can be made too plain for 
beginners; and as I do not expect 
the practitioner, or even the more 
mature student, to take the trou­
ble to follow me through an Intro­
duction which I consider wholly 
unnecessary and superfluous for 
them, I shall not hesitate to stoop 
to the most elementary simplicity 
for the benefit of the younger stu­
dent. I do this more willingly be­
cause it affords a good opportu­
nity, as it seems to me, of exercis­
ing the untrained mind in that 
medical logic which does not seem 
to have been either taught or 
practiced in our schools of late, to 
the extent that might be desired. 

I will now exhibit, in a series of 
propositions reduced to their sim­
plest expression, the same essen­
tial statements and conclusions 
as are contained in the Essay, 
with such commentaries and ex­
planations as may be profitable to 
the inexperienced class of readers 
addressed. 

I. It has been long believed, by 
many competent observers, that 
Puerperal Fever (so called) is 
sometimes carried from patient to 
patient by medical assistants. 

II. The express object of this 
Essay is to prove that it is so car­
ried. 

III. In order to prove this 
point, it is not necessary to con­

suIt any medical theorist as to 
whether or not it is consistent 
with his preconceived notions 
that such a mode of transfer 
should exist. 

IV. If the medical theorist in­
sists on being consulted, and we 
see fit to indulge him, he cannot 
be allowed to assume that the al­
leged laws of contagion, deduced 
[rom observation in other dis­
eases, shall be cited to disprove 
the alleged laws deduced from ob­
servation in this. Science would 
never make progress under such 
conditions. Neither the long incu­
bation of hydrophobia, nor the 
protecting power of vaccination, 
would ever have been admitted, if 
the results of observation in these 
affections had been rejected as 
contradictory to the previously 
ascertained laws of contagion. 

V. The disease in question is 
not a common one; producing, on 
the average, about three deaths in 
a thousand births, according to 
the English Registration returns 
which I have examined. 

VI. When an unusually large 
number of cases of this disease oc­
cur about the same time, it is in­
ferred, therefore, that there exists 
some special cause for this in­
creased frequency. If the disease 
prevails extensively over a wide 
region of country, it is attributed 
without dispute to an epidemic in­
fluence. If it prevails in a single 
locality, as in a hospital, and not 
elsewhere, this is considered proof 
that some local cause is there ac­
tive in its production. 

VII. When a large number of 
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cases of this disease occur in rap­
id succession, in one individual's 
ordinary practice, and few or none 
elsewhere, these cases appearing 
in scattered localities, in patients 
of the same average condition as 
those who escape under the care 
of others, there is the same reason 
for connecting the cause of the 
disease with the person in this in­
stance, as with the place in that 
last mentioned. 

VIII. Many series of cases, an­
swering to these conditions, are 
given in this Essay, and many 
others will be referred to which 
have occurred since it was writ­
ten. 

IX. The alleged results of ob­
servation may be set aside; fIrst, 
because the so-called facts are in 
their own nature equivocal; sec­
ondly, because they stand on in­
sufficient authority; thirdly, be­
cause they are not sufficiently nu­
merous. But, in this case, the dis­
ease is one of striking and well­
marked character; the witnesses 
are experts, interested in denying 
and disbelieving the facts; the 
number of consecutive cases in 
many instances frightful, and the 
number of series of cases such 
that I have no room for many of 
them except by mere reference. 

X. These results of observation, 
being admitted, may, we will sup­
pose, be interpreted in different 
methods. Thus the coincidences 
may be considered the effect of 
chance. I have had the chances 
calculated by a competent person, 
that a given practitioner, A., shall 
have sixteen fatal cases in a 
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month, on the following data: A. 
to average attendance upon two 
hundred and fifty births in a year; 
three deaths in one thousand 
births to be assumed as the aver­
age from puerperal fever; no epi­
demic to be at the time prevailing. 
It follows, from the answer given 
me, that if we suppose everyone 
of the five hundred thousand an­
nual births of England to have 
been recorded during the last half­
century, there would not be one 
chance in a million million million 
millions that one such series 
should be noted. No possible frac­
tional error in this calculation can 
render the chance a working prob­
ability. Applied to dozens of se­
ries of various lengths, it is obvi­
ously an absurdity. Chance, there­
fore, is out of the question as an 
explanation of the admitted coin­
cidences. 

XI. There is, therefore, some re­
lation of cause and effect between 
the physician's presence and the 
patient's disease. 

XII. Until it is proved to what 
removable condition attaching to 
the attendant the disease is ow­
ing, he is bound to stay away 
from his patients so soon as he 
finds himself singled out to be 
tracked by the disease. How long, 
and with what other precautions. 
I have suggested, without dictat­
ing, at the close of my Essay. If 
the physician does not at once act 
on any reasonable suspicion of his 
being the medium of transfer, the 
families where he is engaged, if 
they are allowed to know the 
facts, should decline his services 
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for the time. His feelings on the 
occasion, however interesting to 
himself, should not be even 
named in this connection. A phy­
sician who talks about ceremony 
and gratitude, and services ren­
dered, and the treatment he got, 
surely forgets himself; it is im­
possible that he should serious­
ly think of these small matters 
where there is even a question 
whether he may not carry disease, 
and death, and bereavement into 
anyone of "his families," as they 
are sometimes called. 

I will now point out to the 
young student the mode in which 
he may relieve his mind of any 
confusion, or possibly, if very 
young, any doubt, which the pe­
rusal of Dr. Meigs's Sixth Letter 
may have raised in his mind. 

The most prominent ideas of 
the Letter are, first, that the 
transmissible nature of puerperal 
fever appears improbable, and, 
secondly, that it would be very in­
convenient to the writer. Dr. 
Woodville, Physician to the 
Small-Pox and Inoculation Hospi­
tal in London, found it improb­
able, and exceedingly inconve­
nient to himself, that cow-pox 
should prevent smallpox; but Dr. 
Jenner took the liberty to prove 
the fact, notwithstanding. 

I will first call the young stu­
dent's attention to the show of 
negative facts (exposure without 
subsequent disease), of which 
much seems to be thought. And I 
may at the same time refer him to 
Dr. Hodge's Lecture, where he 
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will find the same kind of facts 
and reasoning. Let him now take 
up Watson's Lectures, the good 
sense and spirit of which have 
made his book a universal favor­
ite, and open to the chapter on 
Continued Fever. He will find a 
paragraph containing the follow­
ing sentence: 

A man might say, 

I was in the battle of Wa­
terloo. and saw many men 
around me fall down and die, 
and it was said that they 
were struck down by mus­
ket-balls; but I know better 
than that, for I was there all 
the time, and so were many 
of my friends, and we were 
never hit by any musket­
balls. Musket-balls, there­
fore, could not have been the 
cause of the deaths we wit­
nessed. 

And if, like contagion, they 
were not palpable to the senses, 
such a person might go on to 
affirm that no proof existed of 
there being any such thing as 
musket-balls. 

Now let the student turn back to 
the chapter on Hydrophobia in 
the same volume. He will find 
that John Hunter knew a case in 
which, of twenty-one persons bit· 
ten, only one died of the disease. 
He will find that one dog at Char­
enton was bitten at different 
times by thirty different mad 
dogs, and outlived it all. Is there 
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no such thing, then, as hydro­
phobia? Would one take no espe­
cial precautions if his wife, about 
to become a mother, had been bit­
ten by a rabid animal, because so 
many escape? Or let him look at 
Underwood on Diseases of Chil­
dren, 2 and he will find the case of 
a young woman who was inoculat­
ed eight times in thirty days, at 
the same time attending several 
children with smallpox, and yet 
was not infected. But seven 
weeks afterwards she took the 
disease and died. 

It would seem as if the force of 
this argument could hardly fail to 
be seen, if it were granted that 
every one of these series of cases 
were so reported as to prove that 
there could have been no transfer 
of disease. There is not one of 
them so reported, in the Lecture 
or the Letter, as to prove that the 
disease may not have been carried 
by the practitioner. I strongly 
suspect that it was so carried in 
some of these cases, but from the 
character of the very imperfect 
evidence the question can never 
be settled without further disclo­
sures. 

Although the Letter is, as I 
have implied, principally taken up 
with secondary and collateral 
questions, and might therefore be 
set aside as in the main irrelevant, 
I am willing, for the student's 
sake, to touch some of these ques­
tions briefly, as an illustration of 
its logical character. 

The first thing to be done, as I 
thought when I wrote my Essay, 
was to throw out all discussions 
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of the word contagion, and this I 
did effectually by the careful 
wording of my statement of the 
subject to be discussed. My ob­
ject was not to settle the etymol­
ogy or definition of a word, but to 
show that women had often died 
in childbed, poisoned in some way 
by their medical attendants. On 
the other point, I, at least, have 
no controversy with anybody, 
and I think the student will do 
well to avoid it in this connection. 
If I must define my position, how­
ever, as well as the term in ques­
tion, I am contented with Worces­
ter's definition; provided always 
this avowal do not open another 
side-controversy on the merits of 
his Dictionary, which Dr. Meigs 
has not cited, as compared with 
Webster's, which he has. 

I cannot see the propriety of in­
sisting that all the laws of the 
eruptive fevers must necessarily 
hold true of this peculiar disease 
of puerperal women. If there were 
any such propriety, the laws of 
the eruptive fevers must at least 
be stated correctly. It is not true, 
for instance, as Dr. Meigs states, 
that contagion is "no respecter of 
persons"; that "it attacks all indi­
viduals alike." To give one exam­
ple: Dr. Gregory, of the Small-Pox 
Hospital, who ought to know, 
says that persons pass through 
life apparently insensible to or un­
susceptible of the smallpox virus, 
and that the same persons do not 
take the vaccine disease. 

As to the short time of incuba­
tion, of which SO much is made, 
we have no right to decide before­
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hand whether it shall be long or 
short, in the cases we are consid­
ering. A dissection wound may 
produce symptoms of poisoning 
in six hours; the bite of a rabid 
animal may take as many 
months. 

After the student has read the 
case in Dr. Meigs's 136th para­
graph, and the following one, in 
which he exclaims against the 
idea of contagion, because the pa­
tient, delivered on the 26th of De­
cember, was attacked in twenty­
four hours, and died on the third 
day, let him read what happened 
at the "Black Assizes" of 1577 and 
1750. In the first case, six hun­
dred persons sickened the same 
night of the exposure, and three 
hundred more in three days.3 Of 
those attacked in the latter year, 
the exposure being on the 11th of 
May, Alderman Lambert died on 
the 13th, Under-Sheriff Cox on 
the 14th, and many of note before 
the 20th." But these are old 
stories. Let the student listen 
then to Dr. Gerhard, whose repu­
tation as a cautious observer he 
may be supposed to know. 

The nurse was shaving a 
man, who died in a few hours 
after his entrance; he inhaled 
his breath, which had a nause­
ous taste, and in an hour after­
wards was taken with nausea, 
cephalalgia, and singing of the 
ears. From that moment the at­
tack began, and assumed a se­
vere character. The assistant 
was supporting another pa­
tient, who died soon after­

wards; he felt the pungent heat 
upon his skin, and was taken 
immediately with the symp­
toms of typhus. 5 

It is by notes of cases, rather than 
notes of admiration, that we must 
be guided, when we study the Re­
vised Statutes of Nature, as laid 
down from the curule chairs of 
Medicine. 

Let the student read Dr. 
Meigs's 140th paragraph soberly, 
and then remember, that not only 
does he infer, suspect, and sur­
mise, but he actually asserts 
(page 154), "there was poison in 
the house," because three out of 
five patients admitted into a ward 
had puerperal fever and died. 
Have I not as much right to draw 
a positive inference from "Dr. 
A:s" seventy exclusive cases as 
he from the three cases in the 
ward of the Dublin Hospital? All 
practical medicine, and all action 
in common affairs. is founded on 
inferences. How does Dr. Meigs 
know that the patients he bled in 
puerperal fever would not have all 
got well if he had not bled them? 

You see a man discharge a 
gun at another; you see the 
flash, you hear the report, you 
see the person fall a lifeless 
corpse; and you infer, from all 
these circumstances. that there 
was a ball discharged from the 
gun, which entered his body 
and caused his death, because 
such is the usual and natural 
cause of such an effect. But 
you did not see the ball leave 

CHILD & FAMILY I VOL. 17, NO.4, 1978 286 



the gun, pass through the air, 
and enter the body of the slain; 
and your testimony to the fact 
of killing is, therefore, only in­
ferential, - in other words, cir­
cumstantial. It is possible that 
no ball was in the gun; and we 
infer that there was, only be­
cause we cannot account for 
death on any other supposi­
tion.s 

The question always comes 
to this: Is the circumstance of 
intercourse with the sick fol­
lowed by the appearance of the 
disease in a proportion of cases 
so much greater than any other 
circumstance common to any 
portion of the inhabitants of 
the place under observation, as 
to make it inconceivable that 
the succession of cases occur­
ring in persons having that in­
tercourse should have been the 
result of chance? If so, the in­
ference is unavoidable, that 
that intercourse must have act­
ed as a cause of the disease. All 
observations which do not bear 
strictly on that point are irrele­
vant, and, in the case of an epi­
demic first appearing in a town 
or district, a succession of two 
cases is sometimes sufficient to 
furnish evidence which, on the 
principle I have stated, is near­
ly irresistible. 7 

Possibly an inexperienced 
youth may be awestruck by the 
quotation from Cuvier. These 
words, or their equivalent, are cer­
tainly to be found in his Introduc­
tion. So are the words "top not 
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come down"! to be found in the Bi­
ble, and they were as much meant 
for the ladies' headdresses as the 
words of Cuvier were meant to 
make clinical observation wait for 
a permit from anybody to look 
with its eyes and count on its fin­
gers. Let the inquiring youth read 
the whole Introduction, and he 
will see what they mean. 

I intend no breach of courtesy, 
but this is a proper place to warn 
the student against skimming the 
prefaces and introductions of 
works for mottoes and embellish­
ments to his thesis. He cannot 
learn anatomy by thrusting an ex­
ploring needle into the body. He 
will be very liable to misquote his 
author's meaning while he is pick­
ing off his outside sentences. He 
may make as great a blunder as 
that simple prince who praised the 
conductor of his orchestra for the 
piece just before the overture; the 
musician was too good a courtier 
to tell him that it was only the 
tuning of the instruments. 

To the six propositions in the 
142d paragraph, and the remarks 
about "specific" diseases, the an­
swer, if any is necessary, seems 
very simple. An inflammation of a 
serous membrane may give rise to 
secretions which act as a poison, 
whether that be a "specific" 
poison or not, as Dr. Homer has 
told his young readers, and as dis­
sectors know too well; and that 
poison may produce its symp­
toms in a few hours after the sys­
tem has received it, as any may 
see in Druitt's Surgery, if they 
care to look. Puerperal peritonitis 
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may produce such a poison, and 
puerperal women may be very 
sensible to its influences, con­
veyed by contact or exhalation. 
Whether this is so or not, facts 
alone can determine, and to facts 
we have had recourse to settle it. 

The following statement is 
made by Dr. Meigs in his 142d 
paragraph, and developed more at 
length, with rhetorical amplifica­
tions, in the 134th. "No human be­
ing, save a pregnant or parturient 
woman, is susceptible to the poi­
son." This statement is wholly in­
correct, as I am sorry to have to 
point out to a Teacher in Dr. 
Meigs's position. I do not object 
to the erudition which quotes Wil­
lis and Fernelius, the last of 
whom was pleasantly said to have 
"preserved the dregs of the Arabs 
in the honey of his Latinity." But 
I could wish that more modem 
authorities had not been over­
looked. On this point, for in­
stance, among the numerous 
facts disproving the statement, 
the American Journal of Medical 
Sciences, published not far from 
his lecture room, would have pre­
sented him with a respectable cat­
alogue of such cases. Thus he 
might refer to Mr. Storrs's paper 
"On the Contagious Effects of 
Puerperal Fever on the Male Sub­
j ect; or on Persons not Childbear­
ing" (Jan. 1846), or to Dr. Reid's 
case (April 1846), or to Dr. Bar­
ron's statement of the children's 
dying of peritonitis in an epi­
demic of puerperal fever at the 
Philadelphia Hospital (Oct. 1842), 
or to various instances cited in 

Dr. Kneeland's article (April 
1846). Or, if he would have re­
ferred to the New York Journal, 
he might have seen Prof. Austin 
Flint's cases. Or, if he had hon­
ored my Essay so far, he might 
have found striking instances of 
the same kind in the first of the 
new series of cases there reported 
and elsewhere. I do not see the 
bearing of his proposition, if it 
were true. But it is one of those 
assertions that fall in a moment 
before a slight examination of the 
facts; and I confess my surprise, 
that a professor who lectures on 
the Diseases of Women should 
have ventured to make it. 

Nearly seven pages are devoted 
to showing that I was wrong in 
saying I would not be 

... understood to imply that 
there exists a doubt in the 
mind of any well-informed 
member of the medical profes­
sion as to the fact that puer­
peral fever is sometimes com­
municated from one person to 
another, both directly and indi­
rectly. 

I will devote seven lines to these 
seven pages, which seven lines, if 
I may say it without offense, are, 
as it seems to me, six more than 
are strictly necessary. 

The following authors are cited 
as sceptics by Dr. Meigs:-

Dewees. - I cited the same pas­
sage. Did not know half the facts. 
Robert Lee. - Believes the disease 
is sometimes communicable by 
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contagion. Tonnelle 
Baudelocque. -Both 
cited by me. Jacque- . 
mier. -Published {cont~ental
three ears after m wrlters y .. y not wen 
Ess~y. KIWlsch..- informed on 
Behmdhand 10 this point.­
knowledge of Puer­
peral Fever.s Paul 
Dubois. -Scanzoni. 
- The story of Von Busch is of in­
terest and value, but there is 
nothing in it which need perplex 
the student. It is not pretended 
that the disease is always, or 
even. it may be, in the majority of 
cases, carried about by atten­
dants; only that it is so carried in 
certain cases. That it may have lo­
cal and epidemic causes, as well 
as that depending on personal 
transmission, is not disputed. Re­
member how smallpox often dis­
appears from a community in 
spite of its contagious character, 
and the necessary exposure of 
many persons to those suffering 
from it; in both diseases conta­
gion is only one of the coefficients 
of the disease. 

I have already spoken of the 
possibility that Dr. Meigs may 
have been the medium of transfer 
of puerperal fever in some of the 
cases he has briefly catalogued. 
Of Dr. Rutter's cases I do not 
know how to speak. I only ask the 
student to read the facts stated 
by Dr. Condie, as given in my Es­
say, and say whether or not a man 
should allow his wife to be attend­
ed by a practitioner in whose 
hands "scarcely a female that has 
been delivered for weeks past has 

PUERPERAL FEVER 

escaped an attack," "while no in­
stance of the disease has occurred 
in the patients of any other ac­
coucheur practicing in the same 
district." If I understand Dr. 
Meigs and Dr. Hodge, they would 
not warn the physician or spare 
the patient under such circum­
stances. They would "go on," if I 
understand them, not to seven, or 
seventy, only, but to seventy 
times seven, if they could find pa­
tients. If this is not what they 
mean, may we respectfully ask 
them to state what they do mean, 
to their next classes, in the name 
of humanity, if not of science! 

I might repeat the question 
asked concerning Dr. Rutter's 
cases, with reference to those re­
ported by Dr. Roberton. Perhaps, 
however, the student would like 
to know the opinion of a person in 
the habit of working at matters of 
this kind in a practical point of 
view. To satisfy him on this 
ground, I addressed the following 
question to the President of one 
of our principal Insurance Compa­
nies, leaving Dr. Meigs's book 
and my Essay in his hands at the 
same time. 

Question. If such facts as 
Roberton's cases were before 
you, and the attendant had had 
ten, or even five fatal cases, or 
three, or two even, would you, 
or would you not, if insuring 
the life of the next patient to be 
taken care of by that atten­
dant, expect an extra premium 
over that of an average case of 
childbirth? 
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Answer. Of course I should 
require a very large extra pre­
mium, if I would take the risk 
at all. 

But I do not choose to add the 
expressions of indignation which 
the examination of the facts be­
fore him called out. I was satis­
fied from the effect they produced 
on him, that if all the hideous cat­
alogues of cases now accumulated 
were fully brought to the knowl­
edge of the public, nothing, since 
the days of Burke and Hare, has 
raised such a cry of horror as 
would be shrieked in the ears of 
the Profession. 

Dr. Meigs has elsewhere in­
voked "Providence" as the alter­
native of accident, to account for 
the "coincidences." (Obstetrics, 
Phil. 1852, p. 631.) If so, Provi­
dence either acts through the 
agency of secondary causes, as in 
other diseases, or not. If through 
such causes, let us find out what 
they are, as we try to do in other 
cases. It may be true that of­
fenses, or diseases, will come, but 
"woe unto him through whom 
they come," if we catch him in the 
voluntary or careless act of bring­
ing them! But if Providence does 
not act through secondary causes 
in this particular sphere of etiol­
ogy, then why does Dr. Meigs 
take such pains to reason so ex­
tensively about the laws of conta­
gion, which, on that supposition, 
have no more to do with this case 
than with the plague which de­
stroyed the people after David 
had numbered them? Above all, 

what becomes of the theological 
aspect of the question, when he 
asserts that a practitioner was 
"only unlucky in meeting with the 
epidemic cases?" (Op. cit. p. 633.) 
We do not deny that the God of 
battles decides the fate of na­
tions; but we like to have the big­
gest squadrons on our side, and 
we are particular that our soldiers 
should not only say their prayers, 
but also keep their powder dry. 
We do not deny the agency of 
Providence in the disaster at Nor­
walk, but we turn off the engi­
neer, and charge the Company 
five thousand dollars apiece for 
every life that is sacrificed. Why a 
grand jury should not bring in a 
bill against a physician who 
switches off a score of women one 
after the other along his private 
track, when he knows that there 
is a black gulf at the end of it, 
down which they are to plunge, 
while the great highway is clear, 
is more than I can answer. It is 
not by laying the open draw to 
Providence that he is to escape 
the charge of manslaughter. 

To finish with all these lesser 
matters of question, I am unable 
to see why a female must neces­
sarily be unattended in her con­
finement, because she declines 
the services of a particular practi­
tioner. In all the series of cases 
mentioned, the death-carrying at­
tendant was surrounded by oth­
ers not tracked by disease and its 
consequences. Which, I would 
ask, is worse,-to call in another, 
even a rival practitioner, or to 
submit an unsuspecting female to 
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a risk which an Insurance Com­
pany would have nothing to do 
with? 

I do not expect ever to return to 
this subject. There is a point of 
mental saturation, beyond which 
argument cannot be forced with­
out breeding impatient, if not 
harsh, feelings towards those who 
refuse to be convinced. If I have 
so far manifested neither, it is 
well to stop here, and leave the 
rest to those younger friends who 
may have more stomach for the 
dregs of a stale argument. 

The extent of my prefatory re­
marks may lead some to think 
that I attach too much impor­
tance to my own Essay. Others 
may wonder that I should expend 
so many words upon the two pro­
ductions referred to, the Letter 
and the Lecture. I do consider my 
Essay of much importance so 
long as the doctrine it maintains 
is treated as a question, and so 
long as any important part of 
the defense of that doctrine is 
thought to rest on its evidence or 
arguments. I cannot treat as in­
significant any opinions bearing 
on life, and interests dearer than 
life, proclaimed yearly to hun­
dreds of young men, who will 
carry them to their legitimate re­
sults in practice. 

The teachings of the two Pro­
fessors in the great schools of 
Philadelphia are sure to be lis­
tened to, not only by their imme­
diate pupils, but by the Profes­
sion at large. I am too much in 
earnest for either humility or van-
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ity, but I do entreat those who 
hold the keys of life and death to 
listen to me also for this once. I 
ask no personal favor; but I beg 
to be heard in behalf of the women 
whose lives are at stake, until 
some stronger voice shall plead 
for them. 

I trust that I have made the is­
sue perfectly distinct and intelli­
gible. And let it be remembered 
that this is no subject to be 
smoothed over by nicely adjusted 
phrases of half-assent and half­
censure divided between the par­
ties. The balance must be struck 
boldly and the result declared 
plainly. If I have been hasty, pre­
sumptuous, ill-informed, illogical; 
if my array of facts means noth­
ing; if there is no reason for any 
caution in the view of these facts; 
let me be told so on such author­
ity that I must believe it, and I 
will be silent henceforth, recogniz­
ing that my mind is in a state of 
disorganization. If the doctrine I 
have maintained is a mournful 
truth; if to disbelieve it, and to 
practice on this disbelief, and to 
teach others so to disbelieve and 
practice, is to carry desolation, 
and to charter others to carry it, 
into confiding families, let it be 
proclaimed as plainly what is to 
be thought of the teachings of 
those who sneer at the alleged 
dangers, and scout the very idea 
of precaution. Let it be remem­
bered that persons are nothing in 
this matter; better that twenty 
pamphleteers should be silenced, 
or as many professors unseated, 
than that one mother's life should 
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be taken. There is no quarrel here 
between men, but there is deadly 
incompatibility and exterminat­
ing warfare between doctrines. 
Coincidences. meaning nothing, 
though a man have a monopoly of 
the disease for weeks or months; 
or cause and effect, the cause be­
ing in some way connected with 
the person; this is the question. If 
I am wrong, let me be put down 
by such a rebuke as no rash de­
claimer has received since there 
has been a public opinion in the 
medical profession of America; if 
I am right, let doctrines which 
lead to professional homicide be 
no longer taught from the chairs 
of those two great Institutions. 
Indifference will not do here; our 
Journalists and Committees have 
no right to take up their pages 
with minute anatomy and tedi­
ously detailed cases, while it is a 
question whether or not the 
"black-death" of childbed is to be 
scattered broadcast by the agen­
cy of the mother's friend and ad­
viser. Let the men who mold opin­
ions look to it; if there is any vol­
untary blindness, any interested 
oversight, any culpable negli­
gence, even, in such a matter, and 
the facts shall reach the public 
ear; the pestilence-carrier of the 
lying-in chamber must look to 
God for pardon, for man will 
never forgive him. 

THE CONTAGIOUSNESS OF 
PUERPERAL FEVER 

IN COLLECTING, enforcing, and 
adding to the evidence accumu­
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lated upon this most serious sub­
ject, I would not be understood to 
imply that there exists a doubt in 
the mind of any well-informed 
member of the medical profession 
as to the fact that puerperal fever 
is sometimes communicated from 
one person to another, both di­
rectly and indirectly. In the pres­
ent state of our knowledge upon 
this point I should consider such 
doubts merely as a proof that the 
sceptic had either not examined 
the evidence, or. having examined 
it, refused to accept its plain 
and unavoidable consequences. I 
should be sorry to think, with Dr. 
Rigby. that it was a case of 
"oblique vision"; I should be un­
willing to force home the argu­
mentum ad hominem of Dr. Blun­
dell, but I would not consent to 
make a question of a momentous 
fact which is no longer to be con­
sidered as a subject for trivial dis­
cussions, but to be acted upon 
with silent promptitude. It signi­
fies nothing that wise and experi­
enced practitioners have some­
times doubted the reality of the 
danger in question; no man has 
the right to doubt it any longer. 
No negative facts, no opposing 
opinions, be they what they may, 
or whose they may, can form any 
answer to the series of cases now 
within the reach of all who choose 
to explore the records of medical 
science. 

If there are some who conceive 
that any important end would be 
answered by recording such opin­
ions, or by collecting the history 
of all the cases they could find in 
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which no evidence of the influence 
of contagion existed, I believe 
they are in error. Suppose a few 
writers of authority can be found 
to profess a disbelief in contagion, 
- and they are very few compared 
with those who think different­
ly, -is it quite clear that they 
formed their opinions on a view of 
all the facts, or is it not apparent 
that they relied mostly on their 
own solitary experience? Still fur­
ther, of those whose names are 
quoted, is it not true that scarcely 
a single one could by any possibil­
ity have known the half or the 
tenth of the facts bearing on the 
subject which have reached such 
a frightful amount within the last 
few years? Again, as to the utility 
of negative facts, as we may brief­
ly call them, -instances, namely, 
in which exposure has not been 
followed by disease, - although, 
like other truths, they may be 
worth knowing, I do not see that 
they are like to shed any impor­
tant light upon the subject before 
us. Every such instance requires a 
good deal of circumstantial expla­
nation before it can be accepted. 
I t is not enough that a practitio­
ner should have had a single case 
of puerperal fever not followed by 
others. It must be known whether 
he attended others while this case 
was in progress, whether he went 
directly from one chamber to oth­
ers, whether he took any, and 
what precautions. It is important 
to know that several women were 
exposed to infection derived from 
the patient, so that allowance 
may be made for want of predis-
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position. Now if of negative facts 
so sifted there could be accumu­
lated a hundred for everyone 
plain instance of communication 
here recorded, I trust it need not 
be said that we are bound to 
guard and watch over the hun­
dredth tenant of our fold, though 
the ninety and nine may be sure 
of escaping the wolf at its en­
trance. If anyone is disposed, 
then, to take a hundred instances 
of lives endangered or sacrificed 
out of those I have mentioned, 
and make it reasonably clear that 
within a similar time and com­
pass ten thousand escaped the 
same exposure, I shall thank him 
for his industry, but I must be 
permitted to hold to my own prac­
tical conclusions, and beg him to 
adopt or at least to examine them 
also. Children that walk in calico 
before open fires are not always 
burned to death; the instances to 
the contrary may be worth re­
cording; but by no means if they 
are to be used as arguments 
against woolen frocks and high 
fenders. 

I am not sure that this paper 
will escape another remark which 
it might be wished were founded 
in justice. It may be said that the 
facts are too generally known and 
acknowledged to require any for­
mal argument or exposition, that 
there is nothing new in the posi­
tions advanced, and no need of 
laying additional statements be­
fore the Profession. But on turn­
ing to two works, one almost uni­
versally, and the other extensive­
ly appealed to as authority in this 
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country, I see ample reason to 
overlook this objection. In the 
last edition of Dewees's Treatise 
on the Diseases of Females, it is 
expressly said, 

In this country, undet no cir­
cumstance that puerperal fever 
has appeared hitherto, does it 
afford the slightest ground for 
the belief that it is contagious. 

In the Philadelphia Practice of 
Midwifery not one word can be 
found in the chapter devoted to 
this disease which would lead the 
reader to suspect that the idea of 
contagion had ever been enter­
tained. It seems proper, therefore, 
to remind those who are in the 
habit of referring to these works 
for guidance, that there may pos­
sibly be some sources of danger 
they have slighted or omitted, 
quite as important as a trifling ir­
regularity of diet, or a confined 
state of the bowels, and that 
whatever confidence a physician 
may have in his own mode of 
treatment, his services are of 
questionable value whenever he 
carries the bane as well as the an­
tidote about his person. 

The practical point to be illus­
trated is the following: The dis­
ease known as Puerperal Fever is 
so far contagious as to be fre­
quently carried from patient to 
patient by physicians and nurses. 

Let me begin by throwing out 
certain incidental questions, 
which, without being absolutely 
essential, would render the sub­

ject more complicated, and by 
making such concessions and as­
sumptions as may be fairly sup­
posed to be without the pale of 
discussion. 

1. It is granted that all the 
forms of what is called puerperal 
fever may not be, and probably 
are not, equally contagious or in­
fectious. I do not enter into the 
distinctions which have been 
drawn by authors, because the 
facts do not appear to me suffi­
cient to establish any absolute 
line of demarcation between such 
forms as may be propagated by 
contagion and those which are 
never so propagated. This general 
result I shall only support by the 
authority of Dr. Ramsbotham, 
who gives, as the result of his ex­
perience, that the same symp­
toms belong to what he calls the 
infectious and the sporadic forms 
of the disease, and the opinion of 
Armstrong in his original Essay. 
If others can show any such dis­
tinction, I leave it to them to do 
it. But there are cases enough 
that show the prevalence of the 
disease among the patients of a 
single practitioner when it was in 
no degree epidemic, in the proper 
sense of the term. I may refer to 
those of Mr. Roberton and of Dr. 
Peirson, hereafter to be cited, as 
examples. 

2. I shall not enter into any dis­
pute about the particular mode of 
infection, whether it be by the at­
mosphere the physician carries 
about him into the sick-chamber, 
or by the direct application of the 
virus to the absorbing surfaces 
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with which his hand comes in con­
tact. Many facts and opinions are 
in favor of each of these modes of 
transmission. But it is obvious 
that in the majority of cases it 
must be impossible to decide by 
which of these channels the dis­
ease is conveyed, from the nature 
of the intercourse between the 
physician and the patient. 

3. It is not pretended that the 
contagion of puerperal fever must 
always be followed by the disease. 
It is true of all contagious dis­
eases, that they frequently spare 
those who appear to be fully sub­
mitted to their influence. Even 
the vaccine virus, fresh from the 
subject, fails every day to pro­
duce its legitimate effect, though 
every precaution is taken to in­
sure its action. This is still more 
remarkably the case with scarlet 
fever and some other diseases. 

4. It is granted that the disease 
may be produced and variously 
modified by many causes besides 
contagion, and more especially by 
epidemic and endemic influences. 
But this is not peculiar to the 
disease in question. There is no 
doubt that smallpox is propagat­
ed to a great extent by contagion, 
yet it goes through the same pe­
riods of periodical increase and 
diminution which have been re­
marked in puerperal fever. If the 
question is asked how we are to 
reconcile the great variations in 
the mortality of puerperal fever in 
different seasons and places with 
the supposition of contagion, I 
will answer it by another question 
from Mr. Farr's letter to the Reg-
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istrar-General. He makes the 
statement that "five die weekly of 
smallpox in the metropolis when 
the disease is not epidemic," -and 
adds, 

The problem for solution is, ­
Why do the five deaths become 
10, 15, 20, 31, 58, 88, weekly, 
and then progressively fall 
through the same measured 
steps? 

5. I take it for granted, that if 
it can be shown that great num­
bers of lives have been and are 
sacrificed to ignorance or blind­
ness on this point, no other error 
of which physicians or nurses 
may be occasionally suspected 
will be alleged in palliation of this; 
but that whenever and wherever 
they can be shown to carry dis­
ease and death instead of health 
and safety, the common instincts 
of humanity will silence every at­
tempt to explain away their re­
sponsibility. 

The treatise of Dr. Gordon of 
Aberdeen was published in the 
year 1795, being among the earli­
er special works upon the disease. 
A part of his testimony has been 
occasionally copied into other 
works, but his expressions are so 
clear, his experience is given with 
such manly distinctness and dis­
interested honesty, that it may be 
quoted as a model which might 
have been often followed with ad­
vantage. 

This disease seized such 
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women only as were visited, or 
delivered by a practitioner, or 
taken care of by a nurse, who 
had previously attended pa­
tients affected with the dis­
ease. 

I had evident proofs of its in­
fectious nature, and that the in­
fection was as readily commu­
nicated as that of the smallpox 
or measles, and operated more 
speedily than any other infec­
tion with which I am acquaint­
ed. 

I had evident proofs that 
every person who had been 
with a patient in the puerperal 
fever became charged with an 
atmosphere of infection, which 
was communicated to every 
pregnant woman who hap­
pened to come within its 
sphere. This is not an asser­
tion, but a fact, admitting of 
demonstration, as may be seen 
by a perusal of the foregoing 
table, [-referring to a table of 
seventy-seven cases, in many 
of which the channel of propa­
gation was evident). 

He adds, 

It is a disagreeable declara­
tion for me to mention, that I 
myself was the means of carry­
ing the infection to a great 
number of women. 

He then enumerates a number of 
instances in which the disease 
was conveyed by midwives and 
others to the neighboring vil­
lages, and declares that 

... these facts fully prove 
that the cause of the puerperal 
fever, of which I treat, was a 
specific contagion, or infection, 
altogether unconnected with a 
noxious constitution of the at­
mosphere. 

But his most terrible evidence 
is given in these words: 

I ARRIVED AT THAT CER· 
TAINTY IN THE MATTER, THAT I 
COULD VENTURE TO FORETELL 
WHAT WOMEN WOULD BE AF· 
FECTED WITH THE DISEASE, 
UPON HEARING BY WHAT MID· 
WIFE THEY WERE TO BE DELIV· 
ERED, OR BY WHAT NURSE 
THEY WERE TO BE ATTENDED, 
DURING THEIR LYING·IN: AND 
ALMOST IN EVERY INSTANCE, 
MY PREDICTION WAS VERIFIED. 

Even previously to Gordon, Mr. 
White of Manchester had said, 

I am acquainted with two 
gentlemen in another town, 
where the whole business of 
midwifery is divided betwixt 
them, and it is very remarkable 
that one of them loses several 
patients every year of the puer­
peral fever, and the other never 
so much as meets with the dis­
order, (- a difference which he 
seems to attribute to their vari­
ous modes of treatment). 10 

Dr. Armstrong has given a 
number of instances in his Essay 
on Puerperal Fever, of the preva­
lence of the disease among the pa-
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tients of a single practitioner. At 
Sunderland, 

... in all, forty-three cases 
occurred from the 1st of J anu­
ary to the 1st of October, when 
the disease ceased; and of this 
number forty were witnessed 
by Mr. Gregson and his assis­
tant, Mr. Gregory, the re­
mainder having been separate­
ly seen by three accoucheurs. 

There is appended to the London 
edition of this Essay, a letter 
from Mr. Gregson, in which that 
gentleman says, in reference to 
the great number of cases occur­
ring in his practice, 

The cause of this I cannot 
pretend fully to explain, but I 
should be wanting in common 
liberality if I were to make any 
hesitation in asserting, that 
the disease which appeared in 
my practice was highly conta­
gious, and communicable from 
one puerperal woman to an­
other. ... It is customary 
among the lower and middle 
ranks of people to make fre­
quent personal visits to puer­
peral women resident in the 
same neighborhood, and I have 
ample evidence for affirming 
that the infection of the disease 
was often carried about in that 
manner; and, however painful 
to my feelings, I must in can­
dor declare, that it is very prob­
able the contagion was con­
veyed, in some instances, by 
myself, though I took every 
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possible care to prevent such a 
thing from happening, the mo­
ment that I ascertained that 
the distemper was infectious. 

Dr. Armstrong goes on to men­
tion six other instances within his 
knowledge, in which the disease 
had at different times and places 
been limited, in the same singular 
manner, to the practice of individ­
uals, while it existed scarcely if at 
all among the patients of others 
around them. Two of the gentle­
men became so convinced of their 
conveying the contagion, that 
they withdrew for a time from 
practice. 

I find a brief notice, in an Amer­
ican Journal, of another series of 
cases, first mentioned by Mr. Da­
vies, in the Medical Repository. 
This gentleman stated his convic­
tion that the disease is conta­
gious. 

In the autumn of 1822 he 
met with twelve cases, while 
his medical friends in the 
neighborhood did not meet 
with any, 'or at least very few.' 
He could attribute this circum­
stance to no other cause than 
his having been present at the 
examination, after death, of 
two cases, some time previous, 
and of his having imparted the 
disease to his patients, not­
withstanding every precau­
tion,ll 

Dr. Gooch says, 

It is not uncommon for the 
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greater number of cases to oc­
cur in the practice of one man, 
whilst the other practitioners 
of the neighborhood, who are 
not more skillful or more busy, 
meet with few or none. A prac­
titioner opened the body of a 
woman who had died of puer­
peral fever, and continued to 
wear the same clothes. A lady 
whom he delivered a few days 
afterwards was attacked with 
and died of a similar disease; 
two more of his lying-in pa­
tients, in rapid succession, met 
with the same fate; struck by 
the thought, that he might 
have carried contagion in his 
clothes, he instantly changed 
them, and met with no more 
cases of the kind. 12 A woman in 
the country, who was em­
ployed as washerwoman and 
nurse, washed the linen of one 
who had died of puerperal fe­
ver; the next lying-in pa­
tient she nursed died of the 
same disease; a third nursed by 
her met with the same fate, 
till the neighborhood, getting 
afraid of her, ceased to employ 
her.l3 

In the winter of the year 1824, 

Several instances occurred of 
its prevalence among the pa­
tients of particular practitio­
ners, whilst others who were 
equally busy met with few or 
none. One instance of this kind 
was very remarkable. A gen­
eral practitioner, in large mid­
wifery practice, lost so many 

patients from puerperal fever, 
that he determined to deliver 
no more for some time, but 
that his partner should attend 
in his place. This plan was pur­
sued for one month, during 
which not a case of the disease 
occurred in their practice. The 
elder practitioner, being then 
sufficiently recovered, re­
turned to his practice, but the 
first patient he attended was 
attacked by the disease and 
died. A physician, who met him 
in consultation soon after­
wards, about a case of a dif­
ferent kind, and who knew 
nothing of this misfortune, 
asked him whether puerperal 
fever was at all prevalent in 
his neighborhood, on which 
he burst into tears, and 
related the above circum­
stances. 

Among the cases which I 
saw this season in consulta­
tion, four occurred in one 
month in the practice of one 
medical man, and all of them 
terminated fatally.14 

Dr. Ramsbotham asserted, in a 
Lecture at the London Hospital, 
that he had known the disease 
spread through a particular dis­
trict, or be confined to the prac­
tice of a particular person, almost 
every patient being attacked with 
it, while others had not a single 
case. It seemed capable, he 
thought, of conveyance, not only 
by common modes, but through 
the dress of the attendants upon 
the patient.l6 
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In a letter to be found in the 
London Medical Gazette for J an­
uary, 1840, Mr. Roberton of Man­
chester makes the statement 
which I here give in a somewhat 
condensed form. 

A midwife delivered a woman 
on the 4th of December, 1830, 
who died soon after with the 
symptoms of puerperal fever. In 
one month from this date the 
same midwife delivered thirty 
women, residing in different parts 
of an extensive suburb, of which 
number sixteen caught the dis­
ease and all died. These were the 
only cases which had occurred for 
a considerable time in Manches­
ter. The other midwives connect­
ed with the same charitable insti­
tution as the woman already men­
tioned are twenty-five in number, 
and deliver, on an average, ninety 
women a week, or about three 
hundred and eighty a month. 
None of these women had a case 
of puerperal fever. 

Yet all this time this woman 
was crossing the other mid­
wives in every direction, scores 
of the patients of the charity 
being delivered by them in the 
very same quarters where her 
cases of fever were happening. 

Mr. Roberton remarks, that lit­
tle more than half the women she 
delivered during this month took 
the fever; that on some days all es­
caped, on others only one or more 
out of three or four; a circum­
stance similar to what is seen in 
other infectious maladies. 

PUERPERAL FEVER 

Dr. Blundell says, 

Those who have never made 
the experiment can have but a 
faint conception how difficult 
it is to obtain the exact truth 
respecting any occurrence in 
which feelings and interests 
are concerned. Omitting partic­
ulars, then, I content myself 
with remarking, generally, that 
from more than one district I 
have received accounts of the 
prevalence of puerperal fever in 
the practice of some individ­
uals, while its occurrence in 
that of others, in the same 
neighborhood, was not ob­
served. Some, as I have been 
told, have lost ten, twelve, or a 
greater number of patients. in 
scarcely broken succession; 
like their evil genius, the puer­
peral fever has seemed to stalk 
behind them wherever they 
went. Some have deemed it pru­
dent to retire for a time from 
practice. In fine, that this fever 
may occur spontaneously, I ad­
mit; that its infectious nature 
may be plausibly disputed, I do 
not deny; but I add, consider­
ately, that in my own family I 
had rather that those I es­
teemed the most should be de­
livered, unaided, in a stable, by 
the manger-side, than that 
they should receive the best 
help, in the fairest apartment, 
but exposed to the vapors of 
this pitiless disease. Gossiping 
friends, wetnurses, monthly 
nurses, the practitioner him­
self, these are the channels by 
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which, as I suspect, the infec­
tion is principally conveyed. 16 

At a meeting of the Royal Med­
ical and Chirurgical Society, Dr. 
King mentioned that some years 
since a practitioner at Woolwich 
lost sixteen patients from puer­
peral fever in the same year. He 
was compelled to give up practice 
for one or two years, his business 
being divided among the neigh­
boring practitioners. No case of 
puerperal fever occurred after­
wards, neither had any of the 
neighboring surgeons any cases 
of this disease. 

At the same meeting Mr. 
Hutchinson mentioned the occur­
rence of three consecutive cases of 
puerperal fever, followed subse­
quently by two others, all in the 
practice of one accoucheur. 17 

Dr. Lee makes the following 
statement: 

In the last two weeks of Sep­
tember, 1827, five fatal cases of 
uterine inflammation came un­
der our observation. All the in­
dividuals so attacked had been 
attended in labor by the same 
midwife, and no example of a 
febrile or inflammatory disease 

of a serious nature occurred 
during that period among the 
other patients of the Westmin­
ster General Dispensary, who 
had been attended by the other 
midwives belonging to that in­
stitution. ls D 

(To be Continued.) 
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ROBERT HEBERT QUICK 


Essays on Educational 
Reformers· 

XI 


THE GENTLEMEN OF 

PORT-ROYAL 


§ 1. IN THE sixteen-hundreds 
by far the most successful school­
masters were the Jesuits. In spite 
of their exclusion from the Uni­
versity, they had in the Prov­
ince of Paris some 14,000 pupils, 
and in Paris itself at the College 
de Clermont, 1,800. Might they 
not have neglected "the Little 
Schools," which were organized 
by the friends and disciples of the 
Abbe de Saint-Cyran, schools in 
which the numbers were always 
small, about twenty or twenty­
five, and only once increasing to 
fifty? And yet the Jesuits left no 
stone unturned, no weapon unem­
ployed, in their attack on "the Lit­
tle Schools." The conflict seems to 
us like an engagement between a 
man-of-war and a fishing boat. 
That the poor fishing boat would 
soon be beneath the waves, was 
clear enough from the beginning, 
and she did indeed speedily disap­

*The seventh of several parts. 

pear; but the victors have never 
recovered from their victory and 
never will. Whenever we think of 
Jesuitism we are not more forc­
ibly reminded of Loyola than of 
Pascal. All educated Frenchmen, 
most educated people every­
where, get their best remembered 
impressions of the Society of Loy­
ola from the Provincial Letters. 
(Pascal) 

§ 2. The Society had a long 
standing rivalry with the Univer­
sity of Paris, and the University 
not only refused to admit the Je­
suits. but several times petitioned 
the Parliament to chase them out 
of France. On one of these occa­
sions the advocate who was re­
tained by the University was An­
toine Arnauld, a man of renowned 
eloquence; and he threw himself 
into the attack with all his heart. 
From that time the Jesuits had a 
standing feud with the house of 
Arnauld. 

§ 3. But it was no mere per­
sonal dislike that separated the 
Port-Royalists and the Jesuits. 
Port-Royal with which the Ar­
nauld family was so closely unit­
ed, became the stronghold of a 
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theology which was unlike that of 
the Jesuits, and was denounced 
by them as heresy. The daughter 
of Antoine Arnauld was made, at 
the age of eleven years, Abbess of 
Port-RoyaL a Cistercian convent 
not far from Versailles. This posi­
tion was obtained for her by a 
fraud of Marion, Henry IV's advo­
cate-general, who thought only of 
providing comfortably for one of 
the twenty children to whom his 
daughter, Made. Arnauld, had 
made him grandfather. Never was 
a nomination more scandalously 
obtained or used to better pur­
pose. The Mere Angelique is one 
of the saints of the universal 
church, and she soon became the 
restorer of the religious life first 
in her own and then by her influ­
ence and example in other con­
vents of her Order. 

§ 4. In these reforms she had 
nothing to fear from her heredi­
tary foes the Jesuits; but she soon 
came under the influence of a man 
whose theory of life was as much 
opposed to the Jesuits' theory as 
to that of the world which found 
in the Jesuits the most accommo­
dating father confessors. 

Duvergier de Hauranne (1581­
1643) better known by the name 
of his "abb aye, " Saint-Cyran, 
was one of those commanding 
spirits who seem born to di­
rect others and form a distinct so­
ciety. In vain Richelieu offered 
him the posts most likely to 
MR. QUICK. a nineteenth century histor­
ian of education. was Assistant Master at 
Harrow. and Lecturer on the History of 
Education at Cambridge. 

tempt him. The prize that Saint­
Cyran had set his heart upon was 
not of this world, and Richelieu 
could assist him in one way only­
by persecution. This assistance 
the Cardinal readily granted, and 
by his orders Saint-Cyran was im­
prisoned at Vincennes, and not 
set at liberty till Richelieu was 
himself summoned before a high­
er tribunal. 

§ 5. Driven by prevailing sick­
ness from Port-Royal des Champs, 
the Mere Angelique transport­
ed her community (in 1626) to 
a house purchased for them 
in Paris by her mother who in 
her widowhood became one of 
the Sisters. In Paris Angelique 
sought for herself and her con­
vent the spiritual direction of 
Saint-Cyran (not yet a prisoner), 
and from that time Saint-Cyran 
added the Abbess and Sisters of 
Port-Royal to the number of those 
who looked up to him as their pat­
tern and guide in all things. 

Port-Royal des Champs was in 
course of time occupied by a band 
of solitaries who at the bidding of 
Saint-Cyran renounced the world 
and devoted themselves to prayer 
and study. To them we owe the 
works of "the Gentlemen of Port­
Royal." 

§ 6. It is then to Saint-Cyran 
we must look for the ideas which 
became the distinctive mark of 
the Port-Royalists. 

Saint-Cyran was before all 
things a theologian. In his early 
days at Bayonne his studies had 
been shared by a friend who after­
wards was professor of theology 
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at Louvain, and then Bishop of 
Ypres. This friend was Jansenius. 
Their searches after truth had 
brought them to opinions which 
in the England of the nineteenth 
century are known as "Evangeli­
cal." According to "Catholic" 
teaching all those who receive the 
creed and the sacraments of the 
Church and do not commit "mor­
tal" sin are in a "state of salva­
tion," that is to say the great ma­
jority of Christians are saved. 
This teaching is rejected by those 
of another school of thought who 
hold that only a few "elect" are 
saved and that the great body 
even of Christians are doomed to 
perdition. 

§ 7. Such a belief as this would 
seem to be associated of necessity 
with harshness and gloom; but 
from whatever cause, there has 
been found in many, even in most, 
cases no such connection. Those 
who have held that the great 
mass of their fellow-creatures had 
no hope in a future world, have 
thrown themselves lovingly into 
all attempts to improve their con­
dition in this world. Still, their 
main effort has always been to in­
crease the number of the convert­
ed and to preserve them from the 
wiles of the enemy. This Saint-Cy­
ran sought to do by selecting a 
few children and bringing them 
up in their tender years like hot­
house plants, in the hope that 
they would be prepared when older 
and stronger, to resist the evil in­
fluences of the world. 

§ 8. His first plan was to 
choose out of all Paris six children 
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and to confide them to the care of 
a priest appointed to direct their 
consciences, and a tutor of not 
more than twenty-five years old, 
to teach them Latin. 

1 should think [says he] it 
was doing a good deal if 1 did 
not advance them far in Latin 
before the age of twelve, and 
made them pass their first 
years confined to one house or 
a monastery in the country 
where they might be allowed 
all the pastimes suited to their 
age and where they might see 
only the example of a good life 
set by those about them. (Let­
ter quoted by Carre, p. 20.) 

§ 9. His imprisonment put a 
stop to this plan, "but," says 
Saint-Cyran, "I do not lightly 
break off what 1 undertake for 
God"; so when intrusted with the 
disposal of 2,000 francs by M. 
Bignon, he started the first "Lit­
tle School," in which two small 
sons of M. Bignon's were taken 
as pupils. The name of "Little 
Schools," was given partly per­
haps because according to their 
design the numbers in any school 
could never be large, partly no 
doubt to deprecate any suspicion 
of rivalry with the schools of the 
University. The children were to 
be taken at an early age, nine or 
ten, before they could have any 
guilty knowledge of evil, and 
Saint-Cyran made in all cases a 
stipulation that at any time a 
child might be returned to his 
friends; but in cases where the 
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master's care seemed successful, 
the pupils were to be kept under it 
till they were grown up. 

§ 10. The Little Schools had a 
short and troubled career of hard­
ly more than fifteen years. They 
were not fully organized till 1646; 
they were proscribed a few years 
later and in 1661 were finally bro­
ken up by Louis XIV, who was 
under the influence of their ene­
mies the Jesuits. But in that time 
the Gentlemen of Port-Royal had 
introduced new ideas which have 
been a force in French education 
and indeed in all literary educa­
tion ever since. 

To Saint-Cyran then we trace 
the attempt at a particular kind 
of school, and to his followers 
some new departures in the train­
ing of the intellect. 

§ 11. Basing his system on the 
Fall of Man, Saint-Cyran came to 
a conclusion which was also 
reached by Locke though by a dif­
ferent road. To both of them it 
seemed that children require 
much more individual care and 
watching than they can possibly 
get in a public school. Saint-Cy­
ran would have said what Locke 
said: 

The difference is great be­
tween two or three pupils in the 
same house and three or four 
score boys lodged up and 
down: for let the master's in­
dustry and skill be never so 
great, it is impossible he 
should have fifty or one hun­
dred scholars under his eye any 
longer than they are in school 

together: Nor can it be expect­
ed that he should instruct them 
successfully in anything but 
their books; the forming of 
their minds and manners [pre­
serving them from the danger 
of the enemy, Saint-Cyran 
would have said] requiring a 
constant attention and partic­
ular application to every single 
boy, which is impossible in a 
numerous flock, and would be 
wholly in vain (could he have 
time to study and correct 
everyone's peculiar defects and 
wrong inclinations) when the 
lad was to be left to himself 
or the prevailing infection of 
his fellows the greater part of 
the four-and-twenty hours. 
(Thoughts c. Ed. § 70.) 

§ 12. An English public school­
master told the Commission on 
Public Schools, that he stood in 
loco parentis to fifty boys. "Rath­
er a large family," observed one of 
the Commissioners dryly. The 
truth is that in the bringing-up of 
the young there is the place of the 
schoolmaster and of the school­
fellows, as well as that of the par­
ents; and of these several forces 
one cannot fulfill the functions of 
the others. 

§ 13. According to the theory 
or at least the practice of English 
public schools, boys are left in 
their leisure hours to organize 
their life for themselves, and they 
form a community from which the 
masters are, partly by their own 
overwork, partly by the tradi­
tions of the school, utterly exclud-
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ed. From this the intellectual edu­
cation of the boys no doubt suf­
fers. "Engage them in conversa­
tion with men of parts and breed­
ing," says Locke; and this was the 
old notion of training when boys 
of good family grew up as pages 
in the household of some noble­
man. But, except in the holidays. 
the young aristocrats of the pres­
ent day talk only with other boys, 
and servants, and tradesmen. 
Hence the amount of thought and 
conversation given to school top­
ics. especially the games, is out of 
all proportion to the importance 
of such things; and this does 
much to increase what Matthew 
Arnold calls "the barbarians' " in­
aptitude for ideas. 

§ 14. What are we to say about 
the effects of the system on the 
morals of the boys? If we were to 
start like Saint-Cyran from the 
doctrine of human depravity, we 
should entirely condemn the sys­
tem and predict from it the most 
disastrous results (1); but from 
experience we come to a very dif­
ferent conclusion. Bishop Dupan­
loup, indeed, spoke of the public 
schools of France as "ces gou[­
[res." This is not what is said or 
thought of the English schools, 
and they are filled with boys 
whose fathers and grandfathers 
were brought up in them, and de­
sire above all things to maintain 
the old traditions. 

§ 15. The Little Schools of 
Port-Royal aimed at training a 
few boys very differently; each 
master had the charge of five or 
six only, and these were never to 
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be out of his presence day or 
night. 

Separate functions 

§ 16. It may reasonably be ob­
jected that such schools would be 
possible only for a few children of 
well-to-do parents, and that men 
who would thus devote them­
selves could be found only at sea­
sons of great enthusiasm. Under 
ordinary circumstances small 
schools have most of the draw­
backs and few of the advantages 
which are to be found in large 
schools. As I have already said, 
parents, schoolmasters, and 
school-fellows have separate func­
tions in education; and even in the 
smallest school the master can 
never take the place of the parent, 
or the school become the home. 
Children at home enter into the 
world of their father and mother; 
the family friends are their 
friends, the family events affect 
them as a matter of course. But in 
the school, however small, the 
children's interests are unconnect­
ed with the master and the mas­
ter's family. The boys may be on 
the most intimate, even affection­
ate terms with the grown people 
who have charge of them; but the 
mental horizon of the two parties 
is very different, and their com­
mon area of vision but small. In 
such cases the young do not rise 
into the world of the adults, and it 
is almost impossible for the 
adults to descend into theirs. 
They are "no company" the one 
for the other, and to be constantly 
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in each other's presence would 
subject both to very irksome re­
straint. When left to themselves, 
boys in small numbers are far 
more likely to get into harm than 
boys in large numbers. In large 
communities even of boys, "the 
common sense of most" is a check 
on the badly disposed. So as it 
seems to me if from any cause the 
young cannot live at home and at­
tend a day-school, they will be 
far better off in a large board­
ing school than in one that would 
better fulfill the requirements 
of Erasmus, Saint-Cyran, and 
Locke. 

§ 17. As Saint-Cyran attribut­
ed immense importance to the 
part of the master in education, 
he was not easily satisfied with 
his qualifications. 

There is no occupation in the 
Church that is more worthy of 
a Christian; next to giving up 
one's life there is no greater 
charity.... The charge of the 
soul of one of these little ones is 
a higher employment than the 
government of all the world. 
(Cadet, 2.) 

So thought Saint-Cyran, and he 
was ready to go to the ends of the 
earth to find the sort of teacher he 
wanted. 

§ 18. He was so anxious that 
the children should see only that 
which was good that the servants 
were chosen with peculiar care. 

§ 19. For the masters his favor­
ite rule was: "Speak little; put up 
with much; pray still more." Piety 

was not to be instilled so much by 
precepts as by the atmosphere in 
which the children grew up. "Do 
not spend so much time in speak­
ing to them about God as to God 
about them:" so formal instruc­
tion was never to be made weari­
some. But there was to be an in­
cessant watch against evil influ­
ences and for good. "In guarding 
the citadel," says Lancelot, "we 
fail if we leave open a single gate­
way by which the enemy might 
enter." 

§ 20. Though anxious, like the 
Jesuits, to make their boys' stud­
ies "not only endurable, but even 
delightful," the Gentlemen of 
Port-Royal banished every form 
of rivalry. Each pupil was to 
think of one whom he should try 
to catch up, but this was not a 
school-fellow, but his own higher 
self, his ideal. Here Pascal admits 
that the exclusion of competition 
had its drawbacks and that the 
boys sometimes became indiffer­
ent. 

§ 21. As for the instruction it 
was founded on this principle: the 
object of schools being piety rath· 
er than knowledge there was to be 
no pressure in studying, but the 
children were to be taught what 
was sound and enduring. 

§ 22. In all occupations there is 
of necessity a tradition. In the 
higher callings the tradition may 
be of several kinds. First there 
may be a tradition of noble 
thoughts and high ideals, which 
will be conveyed in the words of 
the greatest men who have been 
engaged in that calling, or have 
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thought out the theory of it. Next 
there will be the tradition of the 
very best workers in it. And lastly 
there is the tradition of the com­
mon man who learns and passes 
on just the ordinary views of his 
class and the ordinary expedients 
for getting through ordinary 
work. Of these different kinds of 
tradition, the schoolroom has al­
ways shown a tendency to keep to 
this last, and the common man is 
supreme. Young teachers are 
mostly required to fulfill their 
daily tasks without the smallest 
preparation for them; so they 
have to get through as best they 
can, and have no time to think of 
any high ideal, or of any way of 
doing their work except that 
which gives them least trouble. 
"Practice makes perfect," says the 
proverb, but it would be truer to 
say that practice in doing work 
badly soon makes perfect in con­
tentment with bad workmanship. 
Thus it is that the tradition of the 
schoolroom settles down for the 
most part into a deadly routine, 
and teachers who have long been 
engaged in carrying it on seem to 
lose their powers of vision like 
horses who turn mills in the dark. 

The Gentlemen of Port-Royal 
worked free from schoolroom tra­
dition. "If the want of emulation 
was a drawback," says Sainte­
Beuve, "it was a clear gain to es­
cape from all routine, from all 
pedantry." Piety as we have seen 
was their main object. Next to it 
they wished to "carry the intel­
lects of their pupils to the highest 
point they could attain to." 

ESSAYS ON EDUCATIONAL REFORMERS 

§ 23. In doing this they profit­
ed by their freedom from routine 
to try experiments. They used 
their own judgments and sought 
to train the judgment of their pu­
pils. Themselves knowing the de­
lights of literature, they resolved 
that their pupils should know 
them also. They would banish all 
useless difficulties and do what 
they could to "help the young and 
make study even more pleasant to 
them than play and pastime." 
(Preface to Cic.'s Billets, quoted 
by Sainte-Beuve, vol. iij, p. 423.) 

§ 24. One of their innovations, 
though startling to their contem­
poraries, does not seem to us very 
surprising. It was the custom to 
begin reading with a three or four 
years' course of reading Latin, be­
cause in that language all the let­
ters were pronounced. The con­
nection between sound and sense 
is in our days not always thought 
of, but even among teachers no 
advocates would now be found for 
the old method which kept young 
people for the first three or four 
years uttering sounds they could 
by no possibility understand. The 
French language might have 
some disadvantage from its silent 
letters, but this was small com­
pared with the disadvantage felt 
in Latin from its silent sense. So 
the Port-Royalists began reading 
with French. 

§ 25. Further than this, they 
objected to reading through spell­
ing. and pointed out that as con­
sonants cannot be pronounced by 
themselves they should be taken 
only in connection with the adja­
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cent vowel. Pascal applied him­
self to the subject and invented 
the method described in the 6th 
chap. of the General Grammar 
(Carre, p. xxiij) and introduced by 
his sister Jacqueline at Port-Roy­
al des Champs. 

§ 26. When the child could read 
French, the Gentlemen of Port­
Royal sought for him books with­
in the range of his intelligence. 
There was nothing suitable in 
French, so they set to work to 
produce translations in good 
French of the most readable Latin 
books, "altering them just a lit­
tle," as said the chief translator 
De Saci, for the sake of purity. In 
this way they gallicized the Fa­
bles of Phaedrus, three Comedies 
of Terence, and the Familiar Let­
ters of Cicero. 

§ 27. In this we see an impor­
tant innovation. As I have tried 
to explain the effect of the Rena­
scence was to banish both the 
mother-tongue and literature 
proper from the schoolroom; for 
no language was tolerated but 
Latin, and no literature was 
thought possible except in Latin 
or Greek. Before any literature 
could be known, or indeed, in­
struction in any subject could be 
given, the pupils had to learn Lat­
in. This neglect of the mother­
tongue was one of the traditional 
mistakes pointed out and aban­
doned by the Port-Royalists. 

People of quality complain 
[says De Saci] and complain 
with reason, that in giving 
their children Latin we take 

away French, and to turn them 
into citizens of ancient Rome 
we make them strangers in 
their native land. After learn­
ing Latin and Greek for 10 or 
12 years, we are often obliged 
at the age of 30 to learn 
French. (Cadet.) 

So Port-Royal proposed breaking 
through this bondage to Latin, 
and laid down the principle, new 
in France, though not in thecoun­
try of Mulcaster or of Ratke, that 
everything should be taught 
through the mother-tongue. 

Next, the Port-Royalists sought 
to give their pupils an early 
and a pleasing introduction to 
literature. The best literature in 
those days was the classical; and 
suitable works from that litera­
ture might be made intelligible 
by means of translations. In this 
way the Port-Royalists led their 
pupils to look upon some of the 
classical authors not as inventors 
of examples in syntax, but as 
writers of books that meant some­
thing. And thus both the moth­
er-tongue and literature were 
brought into the schoolroom. 

§ 28. When the boys had by 
this means got some feeling for 
literature and some acquaintance 
with the world of the ancients, 
they began the study of Latin. 
Here again all needless difficul­
ties were taken out of their way. 
No attempt indeed was made to 
teach language without grammar, 
the rationale of language, but the 
science of grammar was reduced 
to first principles, and the special 
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grammar of the Latin language 
was no longer taught by means of 
the work established in the Uni­
versity, but by a "New Method" 
written in French which gave es­
sentials only and had for its mot­
to: "To me it will be among the 
grammarian's good points not to 
know everything." (Quintil.) 

§ 29. With this minimum of the 
essentials of the grammar and 
with a previous acquaintance 
with the sense of the book the pu­
pils were introduced to the Latin 
language and were taught to 
translate a Latin author into 
French. This was a departure 
from the ordinary route, which af­
ter a course of learning grammar 
rules in Latin went to the 
"theme," i.e., to composition in 
Latin. 

The art of translating into the 
mother-tongue was made much 
of. School "construes," which con­
sist in substituting a word for a 
word. were entirely forbidden, 
and the pupils had to produce the 
old writer's thoughts in French. 

§ 30. From this we see that the 
training was literary. But in the 
study of form the Port-Royalists 
did not neglect the inward for the 
outward. Their great work. which 
still stands the attacks of time, is 
the Port-Royal Logic, or the Art 
of Thinking (see Trans. by T. 
Spencer Baynes. 1850). This was 
SUbstantially the work of Ar­
nauld; and it was Arnauld who led 
the Port-Royalists in their rup­
ture with the philosophy of the 
Middle Age, and who openly fol­
lowed Descartes. In the Logic we 

ESSAYS ON EDUCATIONAL REFORMERS 

find the claims of reason asserted 
as if in defiance of the Jesuits. 

It is a heavy bondage to 
think oneself forced to agree in 
everything with Aristotle and 
to take him as the standard of 
truth in philosophy. ... The 
world cannot long continue in 
this restraint, and is recovering 
by degrees its natural and rea­
sonable liberty, which consists 
in accepting that which we 
judge to be true and rejecting 
that which we judge to be false. 
(Quoted by Cadet.) 

§ 31. To mark the change, the 
Port-Royalists called their book 
not "the Art of Reasoning," but 
"the Art of Thinking." and it was 
in this art of thinking that they 
endeavored to train their schol­
ars. They paid great attention to 
geometry, and Arnauld wrote a 
book (New Elements of Geome­
try) which so well satisfied Pascal 
that after reading the MS. he 
burnt a similar work of his own. 

Sweet reasonableness 

§ 32. The Port-Royalists then 
sought to introduce into the 
schoolroom a "sweet reasonable­
ness." They were not touched. as 
Comenius was, by the spirit of 
Bacon, and knew nothing of a key 
for opening the secrets of Nature. 
They loved literature and re­
solved that their pupils should 
love it also; and with this end 
they would give the first notions 
of it in the mother-tongue; but the 
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love of literature still bound them 
to the past, and they aimed sim­
ply at making the best 9f the Old 
Education without any thought 
of a New. 

§ 33. In one respect they seem 
less wise than Rabelais and Mul­
caster, less wise perhaps than 
their foes the Jesuits. They gave 
little heed to training the body, 
and thought of the soul and the 
mind only; or if they thought of 
the body they were concerned 
merely that it should do no harm. 

Not only must we form the 
minds of our pupils to virtue, 
[says Nicole] we must also bend 
their bodies to it, that is, we 
must endeavor that the body 
do not prove a hindrance to 
their leading a well-regulated 
life or draw them by its weight 
to any disorder. For we should 
know that as men are made up 
of mind and body, a wrong turn 
given to the body in youth is 
often in after life a great hin­
drance to piety. 

§ 34. But let us not underrate 
the good effect produced by this 
united effort of Christian toil and 
Christian thought. "Nothing 
should be more highly esteemed 
than good sense," (Preface to the 
Logique), and Port-Royal did a 
great work in bringing good sense 
and reason to bear on the practice 
of the schoolroom. When the Lit­
tle Schools were dispersed the 
Gentlemen still continued to 
teach, but the lessons they gave 
were now in the "art of thinking" 

and in the art of teaching; and all 
the world might learn of them, for 
they taught in the only way left 
open to them; they published 
books. 

§ 35. Of these writers on peda­
gogy the most distinguished was 
"the great Arnauld," i.e., Antoine 
Arnauld, (1612-1694) brother of 
the Mere 4ngelique. His RegIe­
ment des Etudes shows us how 
literary instruction was given at 
Port-Royal. In these directions 
we have not so much the rules ob­
served in the Little Schools as the 
experience of the Little Schools 
rendered available for the schools 
of the University. On this account 
Sainte-Beuve speaks of the RegIe­
ment of Arnauld as forming a 
preface to the Treatise on Studies 
of Rollin. In the Regiement we see 
Arnauld yielding to what seems a 
practical necessity and admitting 
competition and prizes. Some ex· 
ceHent advice is given, especially 
on practice in the use of the moth· 
er-tongue. The young people are 
to question and answer each other 
about the substance of what they 
have read, about the more re­
markable thoughts in their au· 
thor or the more beautiful expres­
sions. Each day two of the boys 
are to narrate a story which they 
themselves have selected from a 
classical author. 

§ 36. With the notable excep­
tion of Pascal, Arnauld was the 
most distinguished writer among 
the Gentlemen of Port-Royal. A 
writer less devoted to contro­
versy than Arnauld, less attached 
to the thought of Saint-Cyran and 
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of Descartes, but of wider popu­
larity, was Nicole, who had Made. 
de Sevigne for an admirer, and 
Locke for one of his translators. 

Nicole has given us a valuable 
contribution to pedagogy in his 
essay on the right bringing-up of 
a prince. In this essay he shows 
us with what thought and care he 
had applied himself to the art of 
instruction, and he gives us hints 
that all teachers may profit by. 
Take the following:­

§ 37. Properly speaking it is 
not the masters, it is no in­
struction from without, that 
makes things understood; at 
the best the masters do noth­
ing but expose the things to 
the interior light of the mind, 
by which alone they can be un­
derstood. It follows that where 
this light is wanting instruc­
tion is as useless as trying to 
shew pictures in the dark. The 
very greatest minds are noth­
ing but lights in confinement, 
and they have always sombre 
and shady spots; but in chil­
dren the mind is nearly full of 
shade and emits but little rays 
of light. So everything depends 
on making the most of these 
rays, on increasing them and 
exposing to them what one 
wishes to have understood. For 
this reason it is hard to give 
general rules for instructing 
anyone, because the instruc­
tion must be adapted to the 
mixture of light and darkness, 
which differs widely in differ­
ent minds, especially with chil-

ESSAYS ON EDUCATIONAL REFORMERS 

dren. We must look where the 
day is breaking and bring to it 
what we wish them to under­
stand; and to do this we must 
try a variety of ways for get­
ting at their minds and must 
persevere with such as we find 
have most success. 

But generally speaking we 
may say that, as in children the 
light depends greatly on their 
senses, we should as far as pos­
sible attach to the senses the 
instruction we give them, and 
make it enter not only by the 
ear but also by the sight, as 
there is no sense which makes 
so lively an impression on the 
mind and forms such sharp and 
clear ideas. 

This is excellent. There is a wise 
proverb that warns us that "how­
ever soon we get up in the morn­
ing the sunrise comes never the 
earlier." A vast amount of instruc­
tion is thrown away because the 
instructors will not wait for the 
daybreak. 

Goodness and intelligence 

§ 38. For the moral training of 
the young there is one qualifica­
tion in the teacher which is abso­
lutely indispensable - goodness. 
Similarly for the intellectual 
training, there is an indispensable 
qualification - intelligence. This 
is the qualification required by 
the system of Port-Royal, but not 
required in working the ordinary 
machinery of the schoolroom ei­
ther in those days or in ours. 
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When Nicole has described how 
instruction should be given so as 
to train the judgment and culti­
vate the taste, he continues: 

As this kind of instruction 
comes without observation. so 
is the profit derived from it 
likely to escape observation 
also; that is, it will not an­
nounce itself by anything on 
the surface and palpable to the 
common man. And on this ac­
count persons of small intelli­
gence are mistaken about it 
and think that a boy thus in­
structed is no better than an­
other, because he cannot make 
a better translation from Latin 
into French, or beat him in say­
ing his Virgil. Thus judging of 
the instruction by these trifles 
only, they often make less ac­
count of a really able teacher 
than of one of little science and 
of a mind without light. (Nicole 
in Cadet.) 

In these days of marks and per­
centages we seem agreed that it 
must be all right if the children 
can stand the tests of the exam­
iner or the inspector. Something 
may no doubt be got at by these 
tests; but we cannot hope for any 
genuine care for education while 
everything is estimated. 

§ 39. Whatever was required to 
adapt the thought of Port-Royal 
to the needs of classical schools, 
especially the schools of the Uni­
versity of Paris was supplied by 
Rollin (1661-1741) whose "Way of 
teaching and studying Litera­

ture," united the lessons of Port­
Royal with much material drawn 
from his own experience and from 
his acquaintance with the writ­
ings of other authors, especially 
Quintilian and Seneca. Having 
been twice Rector of the Univer­
sity (in 1694 and 1695) Rollin had 
managed. to bring into the schools 
much that was due to Port-Royal; 
and in his Traite he has the tact 
to give the improved methods as 
the ordinary practice of his col­
leagues. 

§ 40. Much that Rollin has said 
applies only to classical or at 
most. to literary instruction; but 
some of his advice will be good for 
all teachers as long as the human 
mind needs instruction. I have 
met with nothing that seems to 
me to go more truly to the very 
foundation of the art of teaching 
than the following: 

We should never lose sight of 
this grand principle that 
STUDY DEPENDS ON THE WILL, 
and the will does not endure 
constraint. (Quintil. j, I, cap. 3.) 
(2) We can, to be sure, put con­
straint on the body and make a 
pupil. however unwilling, stick 
to his desk, can double his toil 
by punishment, compel him to 
finish a task imposed upon 
him, and with this object we 
can deprive him of play and 
recreation. But is this work of 
the galley-slave studying? And 
what remains to the pupil from 
this kind of study but a hatred 
of books. of learning. and of 
masters, often till the end of 
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his days? It is then the will 
that we must draw on our side, 
and this we must do by gentle­
ness, by friendliness, by per­
suasion, and above all by the 
allurement of pleasure. 

§ 41. The passage I have quot­
ed is from the Article "on giving a 
taste for study"; and if some mas­
ters do not agree that this is "one 
of the most important points con­
cerning education," they will not 
deny that "it is at the same time 
one of the most difficult." As Rol­
lin truly says, 

... among a very great num­
ber of masters who in other re­
spects are highly meritorious 
there will be found very few 
who manage to get their pupils 
to like their work. 

§ 42. One of the great causes of 
the disinclination for schoolwork 
is to be found according to Rollin 
and Quintilian, in the repulsive 
form in which children first be­
come acquainted with the ele­
ments of learning. 

In this matter success de­
pends very much on first im­
pressions; and the main effort 
of the masters who teach the 
first rudiments should be so to 
do this, that the child who can­
not as yet love study should at 
least not get an aversion for it 
from that time forward, for 
fear lest the bitter taste once 
acquired should still be in his 
mouth when he grows older. 

ESSAYS ON EDUCATIONAL REFORMERS 

§ 43. In this matter Rollin was 
more truly the disciple of the 
Port-Royalists than of Quintilian. 
They it was who protested 
against the dismal "grind" of 
learning to read first in an un­
known tongue, and of studying 
the rules of Latin in Latin with no 
knowledge of Latin, a course 
which professed to lead, as 
Sainte-Beuve puts it, "to the un­
known through the unintelli­
gible." They directed their highly­
trained intellects to the teaching 
of the elements, and succeeded in 
proving that the ordinary difficul­
ties were due not to the dullness 
of the learners, but to the stupid­
ity of the masters. They showed 
how much might be done to re­
move these difficulties by follow­
ing not routine but the dictates of 
thought, and study and love of 
the little ones. D 

FOOTNOTES 

(1) A master in a great public school once stated 
in a school address what masters and boys felt 
to be true. "It would hardly be too much to say 
that the whole problem of education is how to 
surround the young with good influences. I be­
lieve we must go on to add that if the wisest man 
had set himself to work out this problem with­
out the teaching of experience, he would have 
been little likely to hit upon the system of which 
we are so proud, and which we call "the Public 
School System." If the real secret of education is 
to surround the young with good influences, is it 
not a strange paradox to take them at the very
age when influences act most despotically and 
mass them together in large numbers, where 
much that is coarsest is sure to be tolerated, and 
much that is gentlest and most refining-the 
presence of mothers and sisters for example-is 
for a large part of the year a memory or an echo 
rather than a living voice? I confess I have never 
seen any answers to this objection which apart 
from the test of experience I should have been 
prepared to pronounce satisfactory. It is a sim­
ple truth that the moral dangers of our Public 
School System are enormous. It is the simple 
truth that do what you will in the way of precau­
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tion. you do give to boys of low, animal natures. 
the very boys who ought to be exceptionally 
subject to almost despotic restraint. exceptional 
opportunities of exercising a debasing influence 
over natures far more refined and spiritual than 
their own. And it is further the simple but the 
sad truth, that these exceptional opportunities 
are too often turned to account. and that the 
young boy's character for a time-sometimes for 
a long time-is spoiled or vulgarized by the in­
fluence of unworthy companions." This is what 
public schoolmasters. if their eyes are not blind­
ed by routine, are painfully conscious of. But 
they find that in the end good prevails; the aver­
age boy gains a manly character and contributes 
towards the keeping up a healthy public opinion 
which is of great effect in restrlUning the evil­
doer. 

(2) Rollin somewhat extends Quintilian's 
statement: "The desire of learning rests in the 
will which you cannot force." A.bout attemfts to 
coerce the will in the absence of interest, may

from a lecture of mine at Bir­
, when 1 did not know that 1 
ch high authorities as Quintil­

ian and Rollin: "1 should divide the powers of the 
mind that may be cultivated in the school-room 
into two classes: in the first I should put all the 

higher powers-grasp of mea~. perception of 
analogy, observation, reflection, unagination, in· 
tellectual memory; in the other class is one pow· 
er only, and that is a kind of mem0l'Y_ that de­
pends on the association of sounds. How is it 
then that in most school-rooms far more time is 
spent in cultivating this last and least-valuable 
power than all the rest put together? The expla­
nation is easy. All the hi~her powers can be exer­
cised onIl when the pupIls are interested, or, as 
Mr. Thring puts it, 'care for what they are 
about: The memory that depends on assocIating 
sounds is independent of interest and can be se­
cured by simple repetition. Now it is very hard 
to awaken interest, and still harder to maintain 
it. That magician's wand, the cane, with which 
the schoolmasters of olden time worked such 
wonders. is powerless here or J?Owerful only in 
the negative direction; and so IS every form of 
punishment. You may tell a boy-'If you can't 
sayyour lesson you shall stay in and write it out 
half-a-dozen times!' and the threat may have ef· 
fect: but no ~nstans tyrannus' from Orbilius 
downwards has ever thought of saying, 1f you
don't take an interest in your work, I'll keep you 
in till you do!' So teachers very naturally prefer 
the kind of teaching in which they can make sure 
of success." 

Reprinted from Essays on Educational Reformers by Robert Hebert Quick as Rewritten in 1890. 
Volume XVII, International Education Series, William T. Harris (Ed.). D. Appleton and Com­

pany. New York, 1902. Chapter Xl, pp. 172-196. 

Editor's Comment: 
The surprising realization that 

emerges from the history of intellec­
tual thought is that great minds and 
innovators build on the great minds 
that precede them. To exemplify from 
philosophy and theology, we have 
Aristotle following Socrates and 
Plato, Aquinas following Aristotle, 
Augustine and Albertus Magnus, 
and Maritain and Gilson following 
Aquinas and other medievalists. 
Twelfth century Bernard of Chartres 
expresses this thought with great hu­
mility: "Like dwarfs standing on the 
shoulders of giants, we see farther 
than they." Those of us who admire 
Maria Montessori and who have fol­
lowed the series on educational re­
formers can't help but be impressed 
by the predecessors who paved the 
way for her great contribution. "Mon­
tessorian insights" from the gentle­

men of Port-Royal are illustrative: 
Choose teachers who "speak little, 
put up with much, pray still more," 
and place a premium on their good­
ness as well as their intelligence; fos­
ter the use of the mother tongue; cul­
tivate a love of literature; adapt the 
elements of learning with a "sweet 
reasonableness" to the mind of the 
learner: attach instruction to the 
senses; avoid wearisome instruction 
and pressure and routine in learning; 
"make study more pleasant than play 
and pastime"; ban reading through 
spelling; "expose things to be under­
stood to the interior light of the 
mind,» for "no instruction from with­
out '" makes things understood"; 
"study and love ... the little ones." 
But for the discrepancy of time, it 
would be easy to believe that the gen­
tlemen were quoting Maria. HR 
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